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mUNG UP: The cafeteria still manages to attract large crowds despite the drop In enrollment. But 
food service sales have declined noticeably. [photo by Eric Nelson]. 

Councll approves budget committee 
Keith Halder Un,iversity and a first year 

student at UMSL. Olivastro rep­
resents new students, yet with 
experience th·at a freshman 
might not have. 

Bob Richardson is chairperson 
of Central Council, a student 
senator on the Senate Curricu-

[continued on page 5] 

Issue No. 264 

Enrollment drop 
affects budget 
Tom Wolf 

An unexpected decline in stu­
dent enrollment is resulting in 
university budget cuts the Cur­
rent has learned. The 655 stu­
dent drop in enrollment will 
mean a likely reduction in 
spending for special equipment. 

, library acquisitions, and reduc­
tions in work hours for students 
cafeteria workers. 

Enrollment this fall is 11.188 
compared to 11.843 in' the fall of 
1975. Enrollment is also down at 
Kansas City and Columbia, but 
rose at Rolla. A loss of $300,000 
in incidental fees is expected to 
result from the drop in students. 

Speculation as to why enroll­
ment dropped so dramatically 
was varied. 

H.E. Mueller, director of ad­
missions, said, "Nothing seems 
to be following a particular 
pattern. Enrollment is down 
though in a number of freshman 
classes. " 

Most sources interviewed said 
the declining birth rate was not 

_ a factor in the decreased enroll­
.ment. "1979 will be tha last 
large high school class," Muel­
ler said. Rather, he cited in­
creased costs and the increase in 
students opting for a career 

education as possible causes for 
the decline. 

The campus food service is 
also feeling the effects of fewer 
students. Revenues are down 15 
per cent overall compared to this 
period 13st year. 

Dan Crane, food service di­
rector, said this was the first 
time in five years that busines 
has not gone up in the cafeteria. 
Because of the 15 per ce nt 
decrease in revenue. hours of 
student cafeteria workers arc 
being cut. 

"I can't raise prices to create 
jobs." explained Crane . "I don ' ! 

think students would stand for 
it. " 

The decline in enrollment wa~ 
unanticipated according to 
Chancellor Arnold B. Grobman . 
University projections for the fal i 
of 1976 were for an expecfed 
increase of 220 students Grob­
man said. -

Cuts resulting from the de­
cline in fees revenue will be 
made in what Grohman calle< 
"flexible funds." Any budge ' 
cuts will ·be considered first b' 
the Fiscal Planning Committe( 
he said : 

The flexible areas in th t 

[continued on page 4] 

The Student Activities Budget 
Committee has recently peen 
selected and approved by 
Central Council. ' The nine stu­
dents selected are Barb Bufe, 
Steve Johnson, Joe Olivastro, 
Bob Richardson, Anne Shelley, ­
Dave Strickfaden, Steve Werner, 
Barb Westermeyer, and Carter 
Whitson. 

The specific purpose of the 
Budget Committee, according to 
Curt Watts, student pody presi­
dent, is to "contribute to the 
student body as 3 curect rep­
resentation of that student 
body" in the region of appropri­
ation of monies toward student 
organizations. 

change was made because the 
only other black member, Steve 
Johnson, appeared to be a 
"token." He added that repre­
sentation of the Current was 
fulfilled by two nominees before 
the change, Bob Richardson and 
Jeane Vogel-Franzi. The object 
had been, according to Watts, to 
avoid . duplication of represent­
ation. -The president solved the 
problc::m by inserting the name 
of Carter Whitson to replace 
Vogel-Franzi on the committee 
list. 

New student elections lack voters 

Committee persons are chosen 
in such a way that " attains the 
vastest representation that nine 
people could offer," said Watts. 

On September 30 of this year, 
Curt Watts and the Executive 
Committee of Central Council 
held a session to nominate nine 
persons. Thirty-one applications 
were received and reviewed by 
the executive committee of Cent­
ral Council. The nine persons 
nominated were Steve Werner, 
B~rb Bufe, Dave Strickfaden , 
Barb Westermeyer, Bob Rich­
ardson, Joe Olivastro, Steve 
Johnson, Anne Shelley, and 
Jeane Vogel-Franzi. 

Later, Watts met with Conney 
Kimbo, dean of student affairs 
to discuss the nominations. After 
the meeting, the list which 

Council was to approve 
alteration. Jeane Vogel-

a woman, had been re­
by Carter Whitson, a 

Watts explained that _the 

Whitson supplied the same 
representation as Vogel-Franzi, 
through the pre-law and political 
science clubs, according to 
Watts. 

He explained that this was 
purely his decision and dispelled 
any notion of pressure from 
Kimbo. "We have a pretty good 
working relationship," he said. 
Ultimately, Watts decided who 
was on the list that was to be 
approved by Council. 

Central Council approved the 
altered list of nominees on 
October 3. The acting SABC 
members represent a variety of 
special interest groups. 

Barb Bufe is an elected mem­
ber of Central Council and 
chairperson of course evaluation 
of Council. She is also a student 
senator working on the Senate 
Curriculum Committee. Bufe is a 
member of Alpha Xi Delta, and 
understands the workings of 
social sororities. 

Steve Johnson is competent in 
the area of Veterans Affairs as 
weJl as representative of other 
black student interests. 

Joe Olivastro is a former 
student at Northeast Mo. S~<lte 
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Earl Swift 

Just over one per cent of 
UMSL's flIst semester students 
voted in the New Student Elec­
tions, held October 5 and 6 in 
the University Center lobby. 
Only 37 of a pOSSIble 3,051 
students participated in the 
voting. 

Of the elected representatives, 
George Reed placed first. fol­
lowed by Dale Fannin, Sue 
Walton, Earl Swift, Bill Powers, 
and Rick Kruckemeyer. Ten 
candidates ran for the six posts. 

The turnout was one of the 
worst ever, according to Jim 
Shanahan, student body vice­
president. "As nearly as I can 
tell, we've done more publicity 
this year than ever before," said 
Shanahan. " We had announce­
ments and a voters' guide in the 
Current, and we passed out 
flyers at least three times in the 
cafeteria and snack bar on both 
the deadlines for running and 
the elecrions. We had around a 
one per cent voter turnout this 
election. On most campuses, 10 
to 30 per cent is considered 
good." 

Many factors may have con­
tributed to the poor voter turn­
out. In a Current poll, it was 
found that, out of those who did 
not vote, .sO -per cent had no 
knowledge of the election. About 
28 per cent stated that they' felt 
the polling times were foo short. 
"I tried to vote, but when I got 
there, they told me the polls wer 
closed, ,-, one student remarked. 

Another 14 per cent stated 
that they did not vote because 
they knew none of the candi­
dates. 

The remaining students polled 
stated that the University Center­
was out of their way. "They 
ought to set up the polls outside 
of all the large lecture halls," 

suggested one tudent,' 'be­
cause a lot of people won't walk 
all the way over to the Univer­
sity Center to vote if their 
classes are in Benton." 

"Perhaps they (new students) 
don't realize what student gov­
ernment can do for people if you 
get the right students in there," 
said Shanahan. "The way it is 
this year, those people elected 
will be representing 35 stu­
dents." 

Ten students ran for positions 
as Central Council representa­
:ives this semester. Of those, six 

--

were elected. Four years ago. 
with fewer new students, the 
election drew 300 voters with 
practically no publicity. 

Election turnouts have beel­
steadily declining at UMSL sincr: 

1972. ''I'd be interested in doin~ 
some research with this semes­
ter' s new students to see exactly 
why they didn't vote," said 
Shanahan. "If we want to im­
prove the voter turnout in the 
future, we've got to find out why 
they don 't vote, and then correct 
the problem ... 

.l1MBEK' Dad and btjIired trees 1ft being trimmed before wiater 
storms hit. [Pboto by Ava Bordeaax·KedcIIck). 

. ' 



'. 

Page 2 October 14, 1976 UMSL CURRENT 

Education survey results in"schedule -changes 
Curt Paul 

For the first time ever, the 
School of Education has con­
ducted a survey to determine 
education students' course 
sche-duling needs. 

The Childhood Education de­
partment sponsored the survey 
which was administered the 
week of September 13 to stu­
dents in all undergraduate edu­
cation classes. 

The survey was given in an 
attempt to . discover, prior to 
submitting a tentative schedule 
for registration, what courses 
students were interested in, as 
well as what days and what 
times would be most convenient 
for them. 

According to Dr. Robert Rea, 
head of the Childhood Education 
department, the survey is an 
endeavor to cut down on the 
number of changes needed in 
the revised schedule, which is 
issued after registration and is 
the actual list of classes to be 
held. 

To what ever extent the re­
vised schedule can be kept simi­
lar to the tentative one, is to 
everyone's advantage, main-

tained Rea. 
"It is an honest attempt," 

said Rea, . ' 'to take this whole 
business of registration less of a 
problem." 

He credited Wallace 
Ramsey, who teaches a Reading 
Methods course, with originating 
the idea for the survey and said 
that, "I'm really pleased that 
someone came up with the 
notion." 

Ramsey asserted that he de­
veloped the idea for the survey 
three or four years ago when he 
was head of the Childhood Edu­
cation department, but could 
never get around to conducting 
such a survey. 

Recently though, he suggested 
the idea to Rea and the survey 
was conducted this fall. 

As an urban, commuter cam­
pus, UMSL needs to schedule 
the courses which students need 
as close together as possible, 
said Ramsey. "Student sched­
uling is going to be more con­
venient because of the survey," 
he said. 

Ramsey ·c1aimed that he has 
never known of a survey such a'5 
this one to be conducted at any 
of five State Universities where 
he has taught. 

Rea said that the general 
response of approximately 700 
students surveyed seemed to 

lOWENBRAU 
MUNICH 

Miller Brewing and 
St. Johns Distributing Company 
are pleased to announce 
the appointment of 

Ron Schroeder 

him twofold. Not only were the 
students suprised at the number 
of courses the School of Educa­
tion offered, but pleased that 
someone was interested in their 
opinion and needs. 

One education student said, 
"I don't mind filling out the 
survey. I didn't see how it could 
possibly affect the scheduling, 

• but I can see that it might 
help. " 

Another said that she was in­
different at the time of ta~mg 
the survey, "I didn't particularly 
think one way or another about 
it." But she hoped that it would 
do some good. 

"I was glad we did it," 
another student said. "I thought 
it was fine." 

One student added, "I 
thought they should have done it 
a long time ago." 

Rea has now received the 
results and some action has 
already ensued. 

Teaching Mathematics in Ele­
mentary School, course number 
153, has been changed from a 
Monday-Wednesday-Friday pat­
tern to a Tuesday-Thursday one 
for the winter semester. 

The Problem of Teaching 
Reading in Secondary Schools, 
course number 365, has been 
added to the tentative schedule 
as an evening class for the 
winter semester. This course 

was not present on the schedule ducting another such survey tor 
before the survey. the winter semester. 

Rea was optimistic about the He said that, " We' re kind of 
department's ability to learn proud of this really, " but that 
from the mistakes of this survey the real test won't come until 
attempt and has plans for con- registration this spring." 

Central CouncD moves 
to Omit discount rates 

Barb Piccione 

Central Council has. passed a 
resolution calling for the limita­
tion of discount rates for Pro­
gram Board events to UMSL 
students, alumni and guests. 

The resolution was initiated by 
Curt Watts, president of the 
student body, and seconded by 
Jim Shanahan, vice-president. It 
passed with one abstention. 

The resolution "calls upon the 
Program Board to review its 
admission pricing policies and, 
with the exception of the policy 
allowing UMSL student, guests, 
or family members a reduced 
price, eliminate any subsidiza­
tion for persons who are neither 
alumni of UMSL nor students at 
this or another university or 
college. " 

Shanahan explained the rea­
soning behind the resolution. 
Though students subsidize the 

shows through the $5 student 
activity fee, Shanahan says the 
shows have primary attraction 
for faculty, staff and the general 
public. 

Shanahan would like to see 
more programs geared toward 
student interests, and fe~s the 
resolution offers a solution. 

,The resolution will go before 
the Program Board which will 
determine whether it will be 
adopted. 

as campus representative for UMSl 

Cashin 
your cans. 

At your Miller Reclamation Center. .. 
• 

Aluminim Cans Only whole or flattened. 

Redeemed for cash 15 cents a pound 

3rd Saturday of each month starting Novem ber 20th ... . lOam to noon on cam pus , . 

The biggest selection 
anywhere. In the most 
colors and sizes. We've 
got it. All in one place. 
Ours. Fall into the Gap 
today. 

~ 
JAMESTOWN. MAJ-L 
W. COUNTY CEN'ER 
NORTHWEST PLAZA . 



'News in brief. .. 
in the petitioning process for 
independent and minority candi­
dates. Shuttle bus applications available 

Students, faculty and staff and 
the public are welcome. Applications for the winter 

Shuttle Bus are now available in 
the Admissions office, room 101 
of the New Administration 

I Building. Students who submit 
applications before Winter Sem­
ester registration will have an 
advantage over those who wait 
until registration, according to 
Neill Sanders, Assistant Director 
of Admissions. 

"If you apply before registra­
tion, your winter schedule will 
go in the computer first. This 
way, any conflicts between your 
schedule of ·c1asses and ·the bus 
schedule can be ironed out." 

The Shuttle Bus routes run 
from two locations, Willmore 
Park and the Venture store at 
Lemay Ferry and Lindbergh. 
Students who need to drive to 
the pick-up locations can park 
their cars at Willmore Park and 

I the Venture parking lot respect­
ively. 

Passes for the Shuttle Bus 
service are S60 per semester. 
This, says Sanders, works out to 
S.78 a day. 

The busses leave the pick-up 
spots at 8: 15 each morning, 
arriving at UMSL in time for 
9:40 classes. There are two 

departure times from the cam­
pus, at 2:45 and 5:15. Riders can 
choose either return time. 

"This is the second year of 
the Shuttle Bus service, and 
everyone seems pleased with it. 
Weare open to suggestions 
from students for new routes 
and pick-up locations," stated 
Sanders. 

During the semester, . the 
shuttle service runs every day 
that classes are in session, 
including during fmal exams. 

For more information, contact 
Sanders at the Admissions of­
fice. 

HU.ffman brings 
campaign here 

MtJdred Huffman, Republican 
candidate for Secretary of State, 
will speak to UMSL students at 
12 pm on Friday, Oct. 22 in 
room 78 J .C. Penney. Huffman 
is opposing incumbent James C. 
Kirkpatrick in the Nov. 2 general 
election. 

Huffman has been critical of 
Kirkpatrick recently for .his fail­
ure to support legislation on 
elections, and for inefficiencies 

McCarthy brings 
campaign here 

.Former Senator Eugene J. 
McCarthy, independent candi­
date for President, will be in St. 
Louis on Monday, Oct. 18. A 
welcome rally and press confer­
ence will be held at Lambert 
Airport at 9 am. 

McCarthy will appear at St. 
Louis Community College at 
Meramec for another rally at 
12:30 pm. 

For further information re­
garding McCarthy's trip to St. 
Louis or his candidacy call 
429-7589. 

Pre-registration 
Although pre-registration 

doesn't begin until November 
8th students are encouraged to 
get help early. Individual ap­
pointments and special groups 
are arranged for those students 
who have not been assigned to ­
faculty advisors, or who have not 
'declared majors. 

Makes new -eons 
as comforta Ie as 

old friends. 

P-fe-wash 
lor jeans 

Soft & Fade. The amazing 
new prewash for jeans ... 
and anything that's denim . 
Absolutely fast. Absolutely 
safe. And absolutely more 
economical than buying 
your denims already done 
in. 

One application of Soft & 
Fade takes out the stiffness 
and makes new jeans super 
soft and easy to live with. 
Soft & Fade is guaranteed 
not to .damage the denim 
fabric, and won't reduce the 
life of the jeans like indus· 
trial washings can. One 
.time through your washing 
machine and you can wear 
your jeans the same day. 
Fade them as much or as 
little as ypu like. 

CLiMACO CORPORATION 
Canton. Ohio 44711 
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Make pre-registration easy on 
yourself. Sign up now. Special 
groups for those who are majors 
in journalism, home economics, 
physical therapy, forestry, busi­
ness, education, etc. should 
come to room 303 Lucas Hall to 
sign up now. 

Blood seminar 
A seminar on sickle cell ane­

mia, its detection, treatment and 
implications, will be held Oct. 26 
at UMSL. . 

Local health and hospital rep-
resentatives, nurses, and 
patients will discuss aspects of ' 
the inherited chronic anemia 
which is found predominantly 
among blacks . Topics include 
social, biological, and genetic 
implications; genetic counseling 
and screening; emergency care; 
and copcerns of nurses and 
patients. 

The program, which will be 
from 8:30 am to 3 pm in the J.C. 
Penney Building, is sponsored 
by UMSL Continuing Education­
Extension in cooperation with 
the St. Louis division of the 
Missouri Federation of Licensed 
Practical Nurses and the Metro­
politan St. Louis- Sickle Cell 
Anemia Association. 

For information about regis­
tration and fees, call 453-5961. 

Rape Classes 
The Stop Rape class returns 

this fall for women who are con­
cerned about the rising rape 
rates and self-protection. The 
course is offered by Communi­
versity. 

A good place to air yo~r 
feelings and fears, the class IS 

half lecture/ rap session devoted 
to the sociology of rape, includ­
ing fine legal points and tips on 
avoidance. 

The secoJ1d half is a practical 
self-defense course designed for 
women to prepare them for a 
wide variety of rape and near­
rape situations. Preston Page. 
who ' teaches Kung Fu, is the 
instructor. 

Classes are beipg held every 
Tuesday evening fr(\m 6:30 to 
7:30 in room 161 Multi-Purpose 
Building. Anyone interested in 
attending the class may call the 
UMSL Information Desk at 
453-5148 or sign up there in 
person. 

The first class will be held on 
Oct. 12. The course lasts for 
eight weeks. Participants should 
wear loose clothing and tennis 
shoes to the self-defense por­
tion. There will be no fee for the 
course. 

Rhodes open to women 
By a recent act of Parliament. 

the Rhodes scholarships have 
been opened to women for the 
first time in 7,3 years. Jerry 
Himelhoch, professor of socio­
logy and institutional represent­
ative for the Rhodes scholarship 
here had joined a group of 
former Rhodes scholars in agi­
tation for the admission of 
women candidates. 

lIe remarked , "I can now 
work to make this opportunity 
available to all UMSL students 
without fee)ing guilty about par­
ticipation in a sexist competi­
tion. " 

The deadline for applications 
for the scholarship for study at 
Oxford University is October 3 t. 
1976. 

All qualified seniors or gradu­
ate students are urged to apply. 
"An outstanding student would 
be wise to apply simultaneously 
for a Rhodes scholarship and for 
other fellowships, such 'as the 
Danforth , Fulbright, National 
Science, or Woodrow Wilson, " 
Himelhoch said. 

Despite the language of the 
official announcement, a candi­
date need not be superhuman to 
qualify. The Selection Commit-

Positions 
now. 

available 

!Ambitious students & Instruc· 
Iton Interested In eamlng extn 
ilncome during spare time. . 

call 

921.2264 Ext: 525 or 343·7672 
after 5:30 pm for Interview 
~ppolntment. Several position! 
now open. 

tee looks for high scholarship 
(probably at least a 3.7 GPA in 
the preceding year). outstanding 
performance in some type of 
independent work. some extra· 
curricular interests. and a hu· 
manitarian concern for other.' 
The candidate need not be al 
athlete. although he or sh 
should be physi cal ly fit aJl' 
enjoy exercise. 

Candidates must be betwec 
the ages of 18 and 24 on Octobe 
I, 1976. although age restri , 
tions may be relaxed for ,I 

candidate who has co mple tel 
national service obligation 
While he or she must be un 
married until the end of the firsl 
year at Oxford. marriage in th( 
second year is ' possible withou 
forfeiting the scholarship. 

Elections will be held in a l 

states in December. 1976 
Scholars-elect will enter Oxfon 
in October. 1977. 

The scholarship pays 3,200 
pounds (about S5,28O in Oct. , 
1976) 'per year plus payment of 
travel costs to and from Oxford. 
Appointment is made for two 
years with a third year probable 
if the scholar's record merits it. 
The scholar may study for either 
an Honours BA or for a graduate 
degree in almost any field or 
profession. 

Daniel G. Coates, an UMSL 
psychology major, was selected 
in 1973 to represent Missouri. 
but missed final selection in the 
regional competition. "Now that 
competition is open to UMSL 
women as well as men, . our 
chances for success are 
greater," said Himelhoch. 

Interested students should 
consult the packet of informa­
tional literature on reserve in the 
library. Applicants are encour­
aged to contact Dr. Himelhoch, 
by Oct. 22 if possible. His office 
hours are 2:45-4 pm on Fridays, 
7:30-8:15 pm Thursdays, or by 
appointment (phone: 453:5284) 

The St. Louis Art Museum presents 

A HISTORY OF THE AMERICAN 
A V ANF-GARDE CINEMA 

October 8 - November 19 

free screenings on Friday at 7pm and 9pm 

special preview seminar with ftlm clips Stuart Liebman, Dept. 
Cinema Studies, N. Y. U. on October 1 at 7pm and 9pm 

financial assistance provided by The Missouri Arts Council 

• 1 
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COMMUNIST CLASSES PROGRESS: Paul Gomberg, member of Progressive Labor Party, leads a 
recent class on revolutionary communism [Photo by Ava Bordeau·Reddlck]. 

Communist courses available 
John Groszewskl 

Members of the Progressive 
Labor Party at UMSL have 
added to their activism on cam­
pus by sponsoring a series of 
classes, scheduled through 
Wednesday, Dec. 1. 

The classes began Sept. 21 
with the topic, "Communist 
Revolution: What is it? Why do 
we need it?" before an audience 
of 10 students. A follow-up class 
the next day attracted about the 
same number of students. 

Other classes include "Elec­
tions: An Illusion of Change; 
Revisionism: Why Russia and 
China Departed from Commun­
ism; Communists and the United 
States Labor Movement; and 
Fight Against Facism: Stalin and 
Soizhenitsyn. 

Classes are sch~duled at two 

week intervals on Tuesdays at 
7:30 pm and Wednesdays at 
11 :30 am. Night classes are held 
in room 75 of J.C . Penney 
building. Room 215 Clark Hall is 
the site for day classes. 

PLP hopes to acquaint people 
with the theory and practice of 
revolutiortary communism. 

Paul Gomberg, assistant pro­
fessor of philosophy and memo 
ber of PLP, said, "We need 
communist revolution because 
the United States is in decline. 11 
is in military decline which is 
predicated on its economic de­
cline. Because the U.S. is in 
decline, it must cut back on 
services to the working class.' 
Violent working class revolution 
is viewed as the cure for these 
ills, says Gomberg. 

Some recent activities of the 
PLP include an UMSL rally in 

support of South African rebels, 
distribution 'Of literature against 
the city stickers and marches 
against the tuition increase and 
non-credit courses. 

According to Richard 
Stephenson, a PLP member and 
instructor, city SUCKerS, 
while being non-compulsory, in­
dicate the age, race, residential 
neighborhood, and sex of the 
driver to aid police in catching 
car thieves. As a result, they 
have been called racist. 

The non-credit courses have 
also been labelled racist by PLP 
since a disproportionate number 
of blacks are enrolled in them. 
The courses, Math 02, 03, and 
English 09, are prerequisites for 
students who have a deficient 
education. 

The PLP welcomes all persons 
to their classes. 

Student enroDment decrease causes 
substantiaJ university budget -cuts ' 

[continued from page 1] 

budget consist of special equip­
ment needed by the various 
departments and new Iibrar) 
acquisitions. These areas wert 
part of last year's budget cuts. 

have problems," Edwards said. 
"We've ' always been able to 

' absorb the increase in food 
prices due to inflation through 
greater use of the (cafeteria) 
facility. " 

sidize everyone's lunch." 
The crunch, Edwards believes, 

is because of the decline in' 
enrollment and a change in 
student schedules whereby they 
are going home early or have 
classes at noon and then going 
home for lunch. 

Senate starts session 
Curt Paul 

The UMSL Senate has begun 
a new business year chaired by 
Dr. Jane Williamson, associate 

, professor of English. She suc­
ceeds Harold Turner as chair­
person. 

Although goals for this year's 
Senate cannot yet be clearly 
defined, Williamson hopes "to 
make the Senate work together 
as a cooperative governing 
body. " 

She views her role as one of 
seeing that major issues get 
discussed in the Senate. 
, Williamson specified three is-

- sues which will merit discussion 
within the next few months. 
These are debate over the basic 
skills development program, 
tenure, and financial-exigency. 

Debate over the basic skills 
development program is sched­
uled ' for the Senate's Oct. 28. 
meeting. A recommendation for 
a Center for Academic Develop­
ment will be presented by - the 
Senate ad hoc Committee on 
Skill Development Programs. 

Developing basic skills of stu­
dents has become a major issue 
since, as the recommendation 

reports, "The majority 'of stu­
denUl who enter UMSL exhibit 
inadequate preparation for col­
lege level work. Many are al­
most prepared, but some oper­
ate on a grade school level." 

According to the committee's 
recommendation, maintaining 
the academic standards of UMSL 
is stressed while providing re­
medial work to make it possible 
for all admitted students to 
accomplish degree credit work 
successfully. 

Other business of the Senate 
will concern the conditions of 
tenure. Possible changes are 
related to faculty probationary 
periods, non regular appoint­
ments and provisions concerning 
the renewal of term appoint­
ments. Simplification of the sys­
tem to determine creditable 
prior service will also be at­
tempted. 

Other issues slated for dis­
cussion include the topic of 
financial exigency. This will fo­
cus problems when there is not 
enough money to keep tenured 
faculty. 

The Senate will meet monthly 
in room 222 of the J.C. Penney 
building at 3:15 pm. The meet­
ings are open to all. 

Pre-law advise necessary 
F~eshman through graduate 

students with the slightest in­
terest in attending law school 
should contact the university's 
pre-law advisor, Dr. Harry Mell­
man, as soon as possible. 

UMSL's catalogue states that 
no law school insists on prere­
quisites or certain required 
courses. However, evidence is 
accumulating which indicates 
that far too many students are 
seriously damaging their 
chances of admission to law 
school by procrastinating their 
preparation for institutions 
'which continue to have between 
eight and 30 applicants for each 
seat in their entering classes. 

Despite the fact that UMSL 
graduates are accepted readily 
in even the "prestigious 
schools" like Harvard, Michi­
gan, NYU, Georgetown, Chica­
go, and Berkeley, as well as 
highly rated state universities, 
~e prudent student, even as a 
freshman, will find that there is 
a program of preparation which 
will enhance his chances for ad­
mission. This preparation has 

benefitted 40 UMSL graduates 
now enrolled as freshmen law 
students. 

Admissions have come from 
every school of the university, 
including the evening college. 
Though a large percentage of 
these admissions are students 
with majors in political science, 
there have been admissions from 
practically every other depart­
ment, with the possible excep­
tions of fine arts and foreign 
languages. 

Mellman's office hours in 543 
Lucas are from 10-12 and 2-4 
Monday, Wednesday and Friday 
and by appointment, phone 
5591. Students who are not able 
to meet at one of these times 
may leave a message in his 
mailbox in 598 Lucas. They 
should indicate where and when 
they can be called. Should this 

.fail to bring 'results, students 
may phone Mellman evenings at 
his home, '725-4775. 

Evening students should not 
hesitate to leave messages or to 
phone since evening appoint­
ments are not a rarity with the 
pre-law advising office . .. I will not act right away," 

said Grobman, speaking of the 
need to give budget recom­
mendations to the Fiscal Plan­
ning Committee. 

Although cuts might come it 
state funding next year becaus( 
of reduced enrollment projec, 
tions, Grobman said he would 
fight to prevent this from hap­
pening. The university system 
receives its funding based on 
enrollment projections for the 
coming year. 

• Declining revenue has been 
experienced from the day-time 
Snack Bar operation. Edwards 
said that business was off 23 per 
cent on Tuesday and Thursday 
in the Snack Bar. 

"For the time being we're 
trying to control costs," Ed­
wards said, "But we can't sub-

THE ULDMATE RIENeE 
mT:~~ 

"I don't expect anymore de­
creases," Grobman added. He 
believes the situation in fees and 
the num\>er of high school 
graduates has stabilized for the 
time being. 

Another area sensitive to stu­
dent enrollment is the student 
activities budget. Conney Kim­
bo, dean of student affairs, told 
the Current that next year's 
budget might well be reduced 
because the enrollment projec­
tions will be lower. 

Kimbo said that enrollment 
was down due to the brighter 
economic picture. He believes 
students entered college in 
greater numbers during the last 
recession because they couldn't 
fwd jobs. 

In regards to the cafeteria 
situation, Bill Edwards, director 
of the university center, said he 
was not ruling out possible price 
increases in the cafeteria menu. 

"If we don't do something 
about c:!ontrolling costs we'll 

Students select 

King and Queen 

New qualifications for the 
UMSL homecoming king' and 
queen candidates have prompted 
a surge in applicants this year. 
Following final stages of the 
selection process, five queen and 
five king candidates wer~ chosen 
from the 13 applicants. 

Queel1l candidates include 
Barb Westermeyer, Evening 
College Council; Marta Royall, 
Alpha Xi Delta; Donna Borg­
meyer, Student Action and in­
volvement League (SAIL); Mary 
Vien, no sponsor; and Barb 
Bufe, no sponsor. 

The five candidates for King 
are Dan Fetsch, Pi Kappa Al­
pha; Jim Shanahan, SAIL; Don­
ald Walter, Sigma Pi; Ron 
Schroeder, Sigma Tau Gamma; 
and Byron Thornton, Epsilon 
Beta Gamma. 

Voting for the candidates will 
be held Oct. 19 and 20 in the 
SSB and U. Center lobbies from 
9 am to 1 pm from 5-7 pm. 



UMSL CURRENT October 14, 1976 Page 5 

Budget committ e controls student ,activity fee 
Dave Strickfaden is a member most fitting replacement from As ' a result of the recent only advise the Budget Commit· 

of the social fraternit , Sigma the available applicants who will changes made in the composi- tee. Students now control the 
[CODtIn~ed from page 11 Tau Gamma, and also works as be approved by Central Council tion of the SABC, students have Student Activity Fund and be-

lum Committee, a member of a trainer in athletics. and Kimbo. Applications for a a greater degree of control over cause of this, according to 
.the University Program Board . Steve Werner is involved with position of the SABC may be the distribution of money to ~atts , Council selected the most 
and the University Relations the Newman Center an~ repre- turned into Central Council student organizations. Now stu- dIverse representation of student 
Board. He is also a member of sents the University Players. ., throughout the year. dent members have the decision interests possible from the ap-
the University Chorus and a Barb Westermeyer supplies Watts explained that the se- making voice. Faculty members plications they received. 
staff member of the Current. the committee with represent- lection process for alternates 
Richardson is . actively involved ation to Evening College and may slow the activities of the 
in many of the dramatic pro- education major interests. Budget Committee down to a 
ductions at UMSL. Carter Whitson represents the certain degree , if a seat is 

Anne Shelley is a member of pre-law club and the political vacated. However , he added, 
Pi Sigma Epsilon, a business science academy. this is the route they have 
fraternity at UMSL, representing No standing alternate commit- chosen in order to maintain 
their interests on the Budget tee will be selected. If a seat is diverse student representation 
Committee. vacated, Watts will choose the on the committee . . 

A new generation 
of College Rings .. 

; 

• 

They're simpler, sleeker-and more feminine than college rings have 
ever been before. Created especially for the woman who wants 

beautiful jewelry as well as a college tradition. 

If you're not sure you want a college ring, be sure to come in and 
take a look at the ArtCarved Fashion Collection. Because if you didn't 

want one before, you will now. 

ArtCarved is not.for women only. They offer the finest selection of 
men's college rings, including. exciting 

new gold signet rings for men. ' 

University Bookstore 
October 20, 21, and 22 10 am to 7 pm 

RING DAY That's when the ArtCarved representative will be here 
to help you select your custom-made college jewelry. 
It's also the day 'you can charge your ArtCarved 
college jewelry on Master Charge or BankAmericard. 

College jewelry by -

JlR~rAD\ /CD SAVE $5 when you pay in full. 

~I \( 'II~ V L World-famous for ~ia~o~d and wedding rings 

BIG HIT AT UMSL: William WtDdom warm. up for hi. Frlday 
evening "Thurber" performance with an afternoon tennl. game on 
UMLS'. courts. [photo by Jeane Vogel·Franzl1. 

Homecoming starts with trivia 
UMSL's first Trivia Contest 

will be held October 20, in the 
J.C. Penney Auditorium. The 
contest will run from 11 am to 5 
pm. The final round will begin 
at 4:30 to decide the masters of 
trivia. 

The host for the 1976 Trivia 
Contest will be Avis Meyer, a 
professor at St. Louis University. 
Meyer is St. Louis' foremost 

authority on trivia and will bring 
his collection of over 3,000 
catalogued facts to host the 
contest. 

Any team of students with 1 
to 4 members can enter. They 
need not represent any esta­
blished campus group. 

Team applications can be 
picked at the Information Desk 
and can be turned in as late as 
Monday, Oct. 18 at noon. 

!Vow at your University Bookstore 

BlOCkbuster Sale! 
43% off 
SUGGESTED RETAIL PRICE 

Perfect 
lamp for 
STUDY 
OFFICE 
CRAFTS 
HOBBIES 

• Full rotation. 45'IOch 
reach, stays In pOSItIOn I 

• With hOrlZo ntat d,e·cast 
bracket. attaches easllyl 

• Takes up to a 100·watt but b 
lor proper. 2tare·lree hghl' 

• Made to be moved - use It In any 
room, for whatever your work l 

• Atternate mounts avaltable lor 
vertical or slant surlaces

' 

M CLASSMATE 100 

Portable, all·purpose superlamp 
that's completely adjustable, for 
proper light in the proper place! 

Stretch It out. rotate It . turn It around 
CL ASS MATE 100 IS adjustable to a touch . 
maneuvers Into any study pOSItion even 
down to the 1I00ri It takrs up to a 100·wali 
bulb lor correc!. glare Iree hght And It'S 
well·bUlIl With tubular steel arms. porcelain 
socket and vented head lor cool opera lion 
and longer hie Looks as good as It works 
too. In your chOice 01 three brlghl baked 
enamel decorator colors 

only $1995 
SUGGESTED RETAIL PRICE S3500 

30·0AY. MONEY·BACK GUARANTEE! 

BY 

KENCAAfT. Industries. tnc. 

Maryland Heights, Mo. 

On Display and on Sale at 
UNIVERSITY BOOKSTORE 

UNIVERSITY CENTER BUILDING 
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I~LWbWN 
FOR$IGN POUCy:, 
'NO OOE TELLS ME 
WWTO ~"PP.f 
C~ICK"fI 
POLAND IS FREE " 
POLAND IS FREt-., 
8~eep,,, C~ICK fl. 
Hf, I'M KEN, 
BARB'£) FRI6ND, 
I'M fJOlNfJ 10 'TH~ 
PROM", 

UPB policy change proposed 
Hearing the sounds Paul McCartney and 

John Lennon on stage together would no 
doubt be shear pleasure to subscribers of the 
Beatie mania. But for those who hold out for 
the return of the successful foursome, their 
hopes can only be described as wishful 
thinking. 

So too is it wishful thinking that the 
present proposal before Central Council will 
bring more overtly student oriented programs 
to the UMSL campus. Those with a longing 
for Gladys Knight and the Pips will have to 
ettIe for an occasional performance like 

William Windom's "Thurber." 
[he latest proposal before Council deals 

with student subsidization of programs 
brought to campus by the University Program 
Board . The proposal calls for an end to the 
subsidy now given to faculty, staff and the 
public. Proponents of the plan hope that by 
making these groups pay the full ticket price 
that attendance will drop dramatically and 
cause the programming board to switch to 

more student oriented entertainment for 
financial reasons . 

In a competitive, economic sense, the 
Council proposal might very well work. 
As uming as the Council does that most 
shows are attended by non-students, a 
dramatic price rise in the faculty and public 
ticket prices would reduce attendance and cut 
back revenues sharply. The promoter then is 
faced with a situation of either changing his 
form of programming or of going broke. 

Unfortunately, the University Program 
Board is not a business and cannot function 
as would a private promoter. It is burdened 
with a fixed budget which must be spent 
within the fiscal year. It cannot borrow to buy 
equipment or adequately promote major pro-

ductions such as rock concerts or Broadway 
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shows. And most of all, it could not absorb 
the financial burden if a major performer did 
not appear. 

Furthermore, it is hard to see why there is 
a need to force the Programming Board's 
hand by economic measures . The Program­
ming Board, with the exception of iiS 
director, Stephanie Kries, is entirely made up 
of students. They decide on what program 
should be brought to campus and the Board's 
funding is approved by an all student budget 
committee . Certainly, ample opportunity has 
been available for these students to change 
the program telection to rock concerts or 
whatever form of entertainment they thought 
would attract a greater student audience . The 
fact that they did not do so seems to attest to 
the fact that it was not physically or 
fin~ncially possible . 

It is not as though ytiuth oriented 
entertainment is not available close to 
campus, as in Columbia. SIU provides 
reasonably priced rock concerts and the town 
is full of movie theatres and discos. However, 
nice it would be to have these things on ' 
campus, the cost and physical limitations 
appear more than students would want to 
bear. 

This does not discount the fact that 
students should not have to subsidize 
performances, especially for staff and the 
general public. If student leaders feel that 
the present programming is not serving 
students then those programs clearly 
should not be funded. 

To date, the Council has presented no clear 
cut evidence that students are not benefit'ing 
from the programs. If it is true, the forum for 
debate lies within student committees and 
the ultimate decision will be made by 
students, as it should. 

Tom' WoK 
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Majority overlooked 
Whil alking into the student 

center -tast week, I was accosted 
!:J Ii seemingly nice person, who 
proceeded to try to sell me a 
copy of one of the many Spcialist 
pamphlets, papers, flyers and 
books. I resisted the temptation 
without any enigma. What this 
did do to me was to make me 
think of the situation that stu­
dents of recent times are in. 

With the elections rocketing 
toward us at a faster rate than 
most people realize, now is an 
opportune time to ponder on 
what we would like to be ' our 
future, and for that matter, the 
future of the world. Students, it 
seems no longer have the active 
interest that they had in the 
sixties: they no longer seem to 
even care about the events that 
will shape the entire rest of their 
lives, and the lives of their 
children. 

Another fact that disturbs me 
is the many letters to the editor 
of the Current claim to represent 
a large portion of the- students at 
UMSL, yet I never see more 
than a few people pushing 
papers, or hear of more than a 
few people ever getting together 
in a meeting or rally. This leads 
one to think that there are really 
just a few people trying to keep 
the cause alive, yet there are 
more than meet the eyes, aren't 
there? 

eo 
This seeming acti-lism is a 

good sign, for it shows that at 
least a few students are con­
scientious enough to try to work 
for something that they believe 
in, rather than the insensibility 
that is displayed in the vast" 
majority of the students. Unfor­
timately it appears as though the 
other side of the coin is not 
represented, that is the demo­
cratic side, and any other type of 
political syste. The Socialists do 
not speak for the majority of the 
students, or for the majority of 
the citizens of the United States. 

In the most recent letters to 
the editor, from people report­
edly representing the Progres­
sive Labor Party, the Young 
Socialist Alliance, and parties 
like the Socialist Labor Party 
that are nationally known, there 
have been claims of worker 
revolutions and working class 
takeovers. All of these claim to 
be for the betterment of the 
society and to bring the worker 
and the minorities out of the rut 
that these parties claim they are 
in. 

As of yet, there has been no 
concrete example of how such a 
system would be run, or kept. 
The pie-in-the-sky type of rea­
soning completely ignores the 
reality of the human condition, 
and refuses the truth of basic 
human characteristics. For ex­
ample, all of these would as­
sume that, after coming to 
power, all of the people would 
be happy with the system. There 
would be no complaining, no 
upper-class, and a seemingly 
totally socialistic type of society. 
Nothing could be far from the 
truth. 

The Progressive Labor Party, 
in their recent letter to the 
Current, said that "Never in 
history has the working class in 
any country taken power through 
elections." This seems to be 
ignoring the present Italian gov­
ernment. 

"Violent Communist revolu­
tion," which is claimed to be the 
only way to achieve the power 
needed to help the masses, is 
also recorded in the annals of 
history. It has been the rare 
exception rather than the rule, 
that a revolutionary party be-.. 

came what it reported to want to 
be at the time of the revolution. 
The revolutionists almost always 
take on the form of the govern­
ment that they had just over­
thrown. 

Several examples are easy to 
give: in modem times the com­
munist government in Russia, 
the present Cuban government, 
and the government headed by 
Mr. Amin; in less recent times 
any dynasty in China (including 
the present one). 

The only solutions to the 
problems of both society and 
individuals are solved by violent 
revolution, claims the letter. 
From the tone of the letter, 
anyone who has any pride in 
self, or any material goods, 
however small, is a capitalist, 
and should therefore be exter­
minated, or jailed. This ignores 
a right that must have little 
value to the Progressive Labor 
Party, the right to life, never 
mind the right to self-determin­
ation and the pursuit of happi­
ness. According to them, every­
one should live in abject poverty 
without even the slightest hope 
of improving themselves. 

What incentive to work would 
a socialist worker have? It has 
been proven in Russia that 
production will fall far short of 
what is needed. 

Leo Tolstoy sites the methods 
of a party _such as the Progres­
sive Labor- Party, "The aim of 

e 
war is murder; the methods of 
war are spying, treachery, and 
their encouragement, the ruin of 
a country 's inhabitants, robbing 
them to provision the army, and 
fraud and falsehood termed as 
military craft... the absence of 
freedom . That is , discipline, 
idleness, ignorance, cruelty, de­
bauchery, and drunkenness. " 

Fortunately such people are in 
the vast minority, even among 
socialists. 

Words are not offensive to 
people, for they can easily 
ignore them. It is the actions 
that tend to get people upset at 
a particular thing. "In civilized 
life, domestic hatred usually ex­
presses itself in a way that 
would seem quite harmless 00 

paper .. " said Screwtape in C.S. 
Lewis' "The Screwtape Let­
ters. " 

The young Socialist Alliance, 
another organization that seems 
to pop up now and then, is also 
shoving literature in the faces of 
unsuspecting students. While a 
seemingly more passible type of 
organization, they advocate the 
take over of the present system. 
They are even more nebulous 00 

the issues that confront a society 
as ours than the Progressive 
Labor Party, fUling their litera­
ture with double meanings aod 
implied reaction so that they will 
have a wide appeal to people. 

The believers in such ideas 
will never confront the reality of 
the fact that people are not built 
by a cast iron mold, and that 
everyone has different needs, 
wants, and goals, not to mention 
there are some people whose 
thirst for power dominates their 
entire existence. 

Uncle Screwtape again offers 
a reply to ideas such as these. 
..... schemes of thought such as 
Creative Humanism, Scientific 
Humanism, or Communism fix 
men's affections not on 
Future, but on the very 
temporality. " 

It is sad to realize that 
can fool themselves i 
Iieving such things are 

In "War and Peace," 
sums up the entire problem 
socialist organizations run 
from. "Man's mind c 

[contln~ed on page 7] 
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PLP up to mischief 
Dear Editor: 

I see the Progressive Labor 
Party (PLP) is up to its usual 
mischief again. One of the 
things that annoys me most 
about politics is that when 
somebody distorts your ideas in 
print, you have to answer them 
in good faith , no matter how 
hard it is to take them seriously. 

The main thrust of PL's ob­
jection to the 1976 Socialist 
Workers Campaign is that it is 
impossible to vote socialism into 
power. No argument there. If it 
were that easy, America would 
never have gotten into a Viet­
nam War. Ho Chih Minh would 
have won the Vietnamese elec­
tion in 1956 (read about it in the 
Pentagon Papers) and that 
would have been that. Salvador 
Allende and a lot of other 
Chileans would be alive today. 
Portugal would have been so­
cialist for the last year and a 
half, since a majority voted for 
either the socialist or communist 
parties in April 1975. 

The Socialist Workers Party 
doesn't run in elections because 
we think we will never be 
allowed to win. If they wouldn't 
let Ho Chi Minh win on the 
other side of world, why would 
they let us win in Washington? 
We have learned from our law­
suit against the FBI that they 
spent thousands of taxpayers' 
dollars over the years to prevent 

us from even ruiming, let alone 
winning. 

If they know they're ready for 
us at the finIsh line, why do they 
bother trying to trip us up at the 
starting line? Why don't they 
feel , like PLP, that it doesn't 
matter whether we run or not? 

Simply because, being a little 
more familiar with real struggle 
than PLP, the FBI knows that 
there's more to winning the 
game than the goal point. A 
political organization grows by a 
process, like all social organ­
isms, and so does the mass po­
litical consciousness which will 
be necessary for a socialist 
revolution in this country. Run­
ning in elections is one of the 
many things we do to contribute 
overtime to that mass political 
consciousness. 

Lenin insisted that the Bol­
shevik Party run in the elections 
for the Duma (Russian parlia­
ment between 1905 and 1917). 
He argued that the Bolsheviks 
would do no service to the 
workers by giving them no 
choice but to vote for the capi­
talists. Lenin wanted the Bol­
shevik Party (which was still 
quite tiny in 1906) to appear as 
a serious alternative to the 
various capitalist parties, not as 
a mere pressure group on the 
sidelines. But maybe Lenin was 
too tame for PLP. 

Nancy Maider 

Need for landmark 
Dear Editor: 

Walt Jaschek's observation of 
the old administration building 
was refreshing . With all the 
negative comments about the 
building being heard on campus, 
it was nice for a change to hear 
something positive. I would like 
to add some information that 
pertains to the old Bellerive 
Clubhouse. 

Last March an application was 
filed with the Missouri Depart­
ment of Natural Resources in 
regard to studying the building 
as a historical landmark. That 
application is still on file and the 
efforts to save the building in 
this manner were supported by 
the Central Council this sum­
mer. 

Overlooked 
[continued from page 6] 

their completeness, but the de­
sire to find those causes is 
implanted in man's soul. And 
without considering the multi­
plicity and complexity of the 
conditions, anyone of which 
take!1 separately, may be seen 
as the cause, he snatches at the 
first approximation to a cause 
that seems to him intelligible ... " 
There are laws directing histori­
cal events, some known, some 
unknown, some cannot be com­
prehended. 

Using people, and demogo­
guery are common practices 
among almost any group that 
wants to come into 1>ower. 
Offering ideal solutions to real 
problems without considering 
any of the variables: encroaching 

other peoples' rights, and 
times violence, are the 
characteristics of these ' 

and Communist "par-

is time to think about the 
ideas that are being voiced so 
loudly, like the clanging gong 
and crashing cymbal, and start 
viocing the opinion of the ma­
jority. 

The application was initiated 
for several reasons . First of all 
there is the sentimental value. 
Secondly, there is the issue of 
space. Last, there is the belief of 
in~equate consideration' on the 
part of the university. 

The building was built in 1910 
as the Bellerive Country Club. It 
became the University of Mis­
souri in 1963 and from this one 
structure evolved our campus as 
it is today. Over 10,000 alumni 
have passed through its corri­
dors. 

The university was asking for 
space all last year. Even still 
there is a shortage of space in 
the University Center. The old 
administration building has a 
total of 44,000 square feet that 
could be utilized by students and 
faculty. The administration ack­
nowledge Project UNITED's 
stand that student organization's 
offices should be close to stu­
dents. How closer can you be 
than the center. of campus? 

Granted the building is in a 
state of disrepair. Understand­
ably so, since the university has 
neglecte4 the building for years. 
I have not been convinced the 
building is unsound though. 

The two engineering reports I 
have heard' about and seen have 
pointed out the building's weak­
nesses. But has the university 
studied the building from the 
viewpoint as to how much would 
it take to save this building 
instead of what is there wrong 
with the building so we can tear 
it down? 

Then again we hear it's a fire 
trap and condemned. If that is 
so the university maintained 
some very vital records in the 
building for years. And if the 
building was condemned nobody 
wou19 be allowed in the building 
today. 

It's time that the old adminis­
tration building enter a ne~ 
perspective before the bulldozers 
arrive. It's worth the effort. 
History is worth a premium for 
without it we would not be here 
today. 

Stephen Platt 
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Big hug and cookies for Jaschek 
Dear Editor: 

As a Bel-Nor resident, I have 
to ask Walt to look at the other 
side of the coin regarding his 
column of Sept. 23. I had to 
smile at your "pulsing-electri­
fied" Inner City that St. Louis 
U. has to offer... you should talk 
with some of their students or 
pe<?ple who work in that area. 
I'll go along with the magnifi­
cent architecture, but suggest 
you research that area and let 
me know if you become "ad­
dicted" to that "overal]. rhythm" 
you wrote about. 

Granted Ye Daily Bread is a 
"goodie" and Left Bank Books, 
as wello· as Forest Park, are. 
plusses for Wash. U. But both 
"expensive" universities have 
been in those neighborhoods for 
a long time and UMSL is still in 
its infancy by comparison. 

Bel-Nor does have Spiro's (an 
UMSL graduate) and now-Ra­
man's Pizza, and perhaps we 
could have had a nice park 
where UMSL now stands... but 
many (not all) of the Bel-Nor 

residents worked hard 0 get 
Bellerive Country Club grounds 
for the Normandy Residence 
Center, which in turn became 
the university you now attend. I, 
too, took advantage of a univer­
sity at my doorstep and obtained 
my MA there, and hope that 

~ some of my children will do the 
same. 

As an Alum., my family 
benefits by e concerts, movies, 
plays, swimming, library, sports 
programs, special events, etc. 
that UMSL makes availa'ble to 
us. I attended the Marillac 
dedication as a former faculty 

. member, and as a Bel-Nor 
resident. I saw many fellow 
residents, who had worked to 
see this dedication a reality. 

As for parking, speed limits 
and stop signs ... we, as tax-pay­
ing residents" can not park on 
the streets and the speed limit 
applies to everyone, not just 
students. (It has been 20 mph 
for many years.) Look at it this 
way, Walt, it slows you down for 

. the 15 mph on campus. 

ESOFAMERICA 

True, there is one stop sign in 
front of a residence, but thats to 
slow down the thru traffic that is 
often ignoring the speed limit. 
Many children' live on that busy 
street and we want them to keep 
on "living". 

·"Those people" you wrote 
about include many UMSL fa­
culty, staff, students and alums. 
Sure we have "little old ladies" 
looking after their lawns ... what 
neighborhood doesn't, but we 
also have "cute gals" washing 
their cars, young families bi­
cycling together, joggers, kids 
on skate boards and lots of 
residents concerned with their 
community. 

UMSL is a vital part of that 
community and one that many of 
us in Bel-Nor are grateful for . 
Come on, Walt ... I'm not big on 
apple pie .. . but you're welcome 
to stop by for mild and cookies , 
and a big hug and kiss if that' s 
what it takes to prove that the 
"paranoid coldness " you felt 
was a figment of your " fine " ! 

Dot Rupich 

"-fiW~ 

STOP ME­
IF'YOOV'E 
HEARD nus ONE". 

M.S.S.C. elaborates on purpose, goals 
Dear Editor: 

The Minority Student Service 
Coalition (a.k.a. M.S.S.C., The 
Coalition) exists to represent the 
needs of black students. Some 
segments of the UMSL com­
munity have begun to question 
the need for a black student 
service organization. Therefore, 
we would like to clarify our goals 
and refute arguments that have 
been raised against us. 

The threefold platform of our 
group is: . 

(1) To facilitate relevant aca­
demic enlightenment at UMSL, 
(2) To serve as a link between 
black students and the St. Louis 
area community, and (3) To 
politicize black students toward 
understanding that the education 
we receive is fruitless, worth­
less, and without merit unless it 
is used to define and articulate 
needs that are relevant to the 
black community. 

It is felt by some that because 
of the "many gains" made in 
the sixties, an activist group 
such as ours is no longer 
functional. 

Grim government statistics 
dispel this fallacy with one of 
the most common denominators 
available: economics. The me­
dian black family income last 
year was only 60 per cent of 
white families or 58,779. This is 
a partial ramification of black 
unemployment being approxi­
mately 14 per cent compared to 
the approximate total average or 
7.5 per cent. Adjusted for in­
flation, blacks are worse off now 
than we were six years ago. 
Other statistics regarding the 

relative status in areas such as 
housing, education, and health 
care are equally depressing. 

Our organization has been 
accused of being more rhetorical 
than practical. Notwithstanding, 
during the 1975-1976 school 
year we participated in 28 dif­
ferent activities. Already this 
year we have raised 5200.00 for 
the United Black Community 
Fund and the NAACP Legal 
Defense Fund, co-sponsored a 
mixer with Epsilon Beta Gamma 
Sodality, manned information 
tables, counseled students, sup· 
ported Students United to Save 
UNITED, and conducted a sur­
vey measuring black student 
attitudes toward UMSL. 

Other routine tasks include 
participating in vanous univer­
sity administrative procedures, 
mediating student complaints, 
stimulating rap sessions, and 
maintaining the Black Culture 
Room. 

Finally, we have been accused 
of practicing racism in reverse. 
We must remind those who 
promulgate this myth that there 
is historically no group of op­
pressed people who have gained 
equality by waiting for the 
society in which they are a part 
to benevolently bestow it. 

Power conceded nothing with­
out demand: It never did and it 
never will. Find out what people 
will quietly accept and you have 
found the exact amount of 
injustice an4 wrong that will be 
inflicte<!. upon . them. I c~nnot 
be reasonably equated that our 
group seeks to revenge past 
evils simply be.cause . we won't 
passively accept the status quo. 

In summation, we witt admi t 
faster than anyone else that we 
aren't doing att that needs to be 
done - but we are doing 
something. Our contribution and 
our tenacity has not and will not 
be substantiatty mitigated by 
misconceptions or lack of con· 
cern. 

We will continue to do what 
we feel needs to be donI! 
because we agree with the 
postulation of Frederick Douglas 
when he said, "In the course of 
human events one thing is 
certain. Black people may not 
get everything that we pay for 
but we will certainly pay for 
everything that \\:e get." 

. Eric Banks 

Bee question 
Dear Editor: 

Re:Bees 
I'm glad someone finally no­

ticed that those insects around 
trash cans are not malevolent 
flies. However, I would ap­
preciate an expert opinion on a 
puzzling event; recently during a 
picnic behind Lucas Hall, a large 
bee explored the bar-b-que 
chicken, flew away, then re­
turned with reinforcements. 
They would saw away chunks as 
large as they could carry, and 
then return for more. 

I can understand soda syrup, 
but chicken? (And not very good 
bar-b-qued chicken at that.) 
Please do explain if possible, 
and I am very serious - I never 
had any idea that bees were 
carnivorous. 

S. Zumwalt 
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Back Greeks:active part -of UM L 
. be traced back in history," said groups on campus - they nave and our people. There are per-

Ruth Thaler 

It appears to the naked eye 
that there are separate social 
groupings among 'students at 
UMSL, and that the incidence of 
mixed black and white student 
gatherings is suspiciously low. 

Perhaps a look at the trad­
itional bastions of campus social 
life, the Greek societies, offers 
some insight. One problem at 
UMSL, however, is that the 
active sororities and fraternities 
blend in with daily campus life 
and are rarely thought of in 
terms of race. 

Although all fraternities and 
sororities can be represented on 
the UMSL Inter-Greek Council, 
there. is a separation between 
"white Greeks" and "black 
Gieeks. " 

There are eight black Greek 
societies recognized by the Na­
tional Pan Hellenic Council, the 
national black Greek society 
organiztion . Of these, Kappa 
Alpha Psi , and Omega Psi Phi 
(known as Q Psi Phi" or "Q'" 
fraternities are on the UMSl 
campus. Sigma Gamma Rho and 
Delta Sigma Theta sororities 
are also present. 

The fifth predominantly black 
Greek society here is Epsilon 
Beta Gamma. Begun in January 
1975, it is unique to the UMSL 
campus and is not as yet 
affiliated with the national soc­
iety. Epsilon is considered a so­
dality, ~hich means that both 
men and women can be member 
of the same group. 

Since the charters of area 
fraternities and sororities are at 
one school, while members may 
be attending one of several local 
colleges and universities, the 
St. Louis chapters are consi­
dered metropolitan. Usually each 

Claudette Feenster, a member of always been separate, and it just sonal reasons for people joining 
Sigma Gamma Rho sorority. continues that way. No one different sororities or fraternities 

"Blacks were not included in bothers to cross over." as well as concerns about black 
campus social activities, and One reason that Omega Psi people in general." 
therefore established their own Phi is visible on campus is that "I pledged Sigma because of 
societies," Feenster stated. members are proud to be a part the people in the sorority, rather 

"The charters of St. Louis of this fraternity. They have than what the group does. 1 felt 
black Greek societies are located standards for our members as that the sisters in Sigma were 
at Harris Teachers College. This well as strong national and local down-to-earth and I had friends 
is because, in the past, Harris . projects. For example, we spon- in the sorority already. It just 
was the only area coll~e with sor an essay contest which gives seemed like a natural choice," 
black student population." the winner a scholarship, we says Margaret McClelland. 

support the activities of organi- Cynthia Boone fells the same, 

school in an area houses a 
chapter, each having separat( 
charters. 

According to Byron Thornton, 
historian for Epsilon Beta 
Gamma sodality, "racial dis- . 
crimination is the real reason 
that black Greeks got started. 
Blacks were excluded from the 
existing Greek societies, and 
were forced to organize separate 
grou ps for themselves." 

Kevin Ryland, a member of 
Omega Psi Phi, stated, "When 
black Greek societies began, 
many whites were afraid that 
black militancy was a part of the . 
groups' purpose. Many black 
students were, and still are , 
afraid of racism and felt uncom­
fortalble around white students. 
In away, the black fraternities 
were a form of self-protection 
and the only way that black 
students could have a social life 
since they were excluded from 
the majority." 

Sororities members echo sim­
ilar sentiments. "The separatism 
of black and white sororities can 

If history provides the answer 
to why Greek societies were 
separated by race, why does this 
separation still exist, and what is 
the possibility of breaking these 
barriers? 

" Race is not an issue," said 
John Higgins of Epsilon Beta 
Gamma. "If a white student 
wanted to pledge with us, he or 
she would be accepted." 

" One reason that blacks don't 
really make a move to join white 
frats," he added, "is that we 
don't like to go where we're not 
wanted." 

Ryland atso felt that race is 
not an issue in joining fratern­
ities at this time. "Omega Psi 
Phi does have white members in 
several chapters. The separation 
of blacks and whites never has 
been legal; it was more a social, 
'unspoken law' situation 
White students don't really show 
interest in the black Greeks, but 
if someone did we wouldn't 
turn them down. 

"Pledging is a mental thing," 
Ryland added. "A white student 
might have trouble adjusting to 
blacks and a black organization, 
epsecially since our civic and 
social action projects are geared 
to the black community." 

Kerry Terry, Vice· Pol march 
. (similar to vice-president) of 
Kappa Alpha Psi feels, "There 
is no deliberate separation be­
tween black and white Greeks at 
UMSL; but at the same time 
there is no unity either. 

"I think the problem is the 
same with other black and white 

MENSTRUAL PROBLEMS 

A Research Program Offering Free Treat­
ment for menstrual problems is avai lable 
this semester under the auspices of the 
Pshycological Services Center of Washing­
ton University. Treatment will be offered to . 
women who experience tension, depression, 
or other problems in the premenstrual week 
and/or severe pain or other problems during 
menstruation. 
For further information phone 
Ext .. 4905, from 9am to 3pm 
through Friday. 

863-0100, 
Monday 

zations such as PUSH, the "I was interested in Sigma 
Urban League, the NAACP. Gamma Rho since high school. It 

Kappa pledges are involved in 
community projects as part of 

is the only sorority with a high 
school-level interest group in St. 
Louis." 

eatu e 
their pledge responsibilities. 
"We feel that community action 
is important to the frat and the 
individual," says Turner. " Our 
pledges are required. to do some 
type of community service be­
fore being initiated into the 
fraternity. 

Social action is the calling 
card of Sigma Gamma Rho 
sorority which distinguishes 
them from their sister organi­
zations. "We have always been 
known for involvement in the 
community," stated Feenster. 

"There really is not a unique 
character to the different black 
Greeks as 1 see it, because we 
are all committed to a similar 

of bettering ourselve~_ 

3rd big week! 

MunIer by 
Now n ~ 
Showln4JelJ II IpGI 

711·3300 
6706 Rd. 

"Black Greeks are lifetime 
groups," Ryland explained. 
"The graduate chapters are just 
as active as undergrad, and 
every bit as strong. Once you 
become a Q, or another frat 
member, you have .a life-long 
connection with your fraternity 
brothers. You can go anywhere 
and find friends." 

Black Greeks at UMSL ex­
emplify one of the important 
aspects of the commuter univer­
sity - involvement with the 
community. The fraternities, 
sororities, and sodality serve to 
unite students and provide a 
feeling of belonging on a cam­
pus which often suffers from 
uninvolvement. 

Everyone is invited to 
the 

I CtI~llt' St?Ctrc:1l f()r Central Council 

A§rlrlll~ Illt~rtCtIIl~r§ 

~ake advantage of an opP9rtunity to perform 
at a new and growing establishment 

At the Ben Franklin Motor Hotel 
across from the Red Carpet Inn on North lindbergh 

£()lla Barbara Schmidt 
894-1957 9 am to 5 pm 

for ful/ 'details 

Coffeehouse 
9 to I2:30 
October IS 

U. Center Lounge 
ll~~ 

Illt~rtCtlllrn~llt 
FREE coffee, cookies 
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Gude gains insight to Indian life 

) 

Thomas Taschlnger 

"I was struck by the constant, 
pervading sense of humanity in 
India. Even in the rural areas, 
you're never very far from the 
next village. You're always in 
reach of human culture," said 
Ray Gude, a 22-year-old anthro­
pology student who returned last 
week from a three-month visit to 
India. 

Gude , who graduated from 
UMSL last May, went to India 
under the auspices of a scholar­
ship from the Experiment in 
International Living (Ell). The 
Ell is a world-wide organization 
dedicated to strengthening ties 
between people of different 
countries and giving them the 
opportunity to live in another 
culture as a native citizen. 

"I was with seven other 
American students on this trip," 
Gude said. "After a three-day 
orientation in Vermont, we flew 
to India and landed in Bombay 
on July 8, during the heart of 
the monsoon season. 

"It was extremely humid and 
I never saw so much rain in my 
life. It rained hard - really hard 
- throughout the day with only 
a few breaks. The area we were 
staying in experienced at that 
time its' worst flood in 200 
years. " 

"Gujarat is one of the most 
traditional states in India ," 
Gude said. "Most of its resi­
dents are members of the Hindu 
religion and strict vegetarian. 

"Because of t he unfamiliar 
diet and other adjustment prob­
lems, we were all frequently sick 
with diarrhea and dysentery for 
the first few weeks. I ate a lot of 
slimy green vegetables I didn't 
recognize. 

"I alsb ate a lot of rice. and 
curry, a type of soup broth. 
Indian food is also unbelievably 
spicy. I had some green chilis 
that were incredibly hot. " 

The food was not the only 
thing Gude had trouble adjust­
ing to. "The intent of the Ell 
program was for me to live with 
an Indian family, as an Indian, 
for three weeks. Yet, I quickly 
found out that the Indian culture 
does not permit such ,f'apid 
assimilation. 

"Most of the trip was care- . 
fully planned, and consequently 
I often felt stifled. I attended 
many arranged teas and dinners, 

but I wasn't able to wander 
around alone very much. 

Gude spent the first three 
weeks of his visit with Arun 

Shah, and his wife, Anju, who are 
both architects and members of 
India's burgeoning middle class. 
The Shah family lives in Baroda, 
a sma\1 city north of Bombay in 
Gujarat state. . 

"One thing that surprised me 
about India, " Gude continued, 
"was the development of the 
tourist industry. I was mildly 
disappointed to see that most 
places of interest wert! heavily 
geared to tourism. We saw 
groups or busloads of tourists at 
most sites. 
"On~ of the more fascinating 

places' I visited was J aipur, The 
Pink City, " he said, .. an area in 
the center of the city comprising 
about ten square blocks was 

,.~ Woman's Problems: 
We 'Can Help" 

In our commitment to help solve the special~ prob­
lems faced by women , the Hope Clinic tor Women 
offers a full range of professional services: vacuum 
abortion , tubal sterilizatioh , pregnancy testing, birth 

contro l. 

But because we also believe your emotional welle 
being is equally important, we balance our physical 
services with a complete counseling program, A 
trained professional staff enables you to discuss 
your special prob lems in the light of your own special 
needs , Every alternative is considered and 
proper referrals given when indicated, 

We bel ieve decisions 
are easier when the 
choices are clear. 
Just give us a call , or 
write , and we will 
get you the answers, 

Never feel alone, We 
care, We can help, 

HThe 
ope 

Clinic 
for 

Women 
An outpatient surgical center 

lor the phYSica l and emohonal needs 01 a woman 

(618) 451-5722 1602 21 st St.lGranite City. Illinois 62040 

built in the eleventh century 
A.D. All the buildings are pink, 
and the effect is quite am­
azing." 

Gude spent ten days at the 
University of Delhi to fmd out 
what Indian college life was like. 
"Quite frankly, it was a lot like 
college life here," he said. 

"I talked to an American girl 
from Stanford University who 
had been in India for a year. She 
said one difference between the 
American and Indian' university 
systems seemed to be the less 
difficplt Indian academic stan­
dards. 

"She said an Indian bache­
lor's degree was roughly similar 
to an American (2-year) associ­
ate degree, and an Indian mas­
ter's was comparable to an 
American bachelor's." 

In July of 1975 Prime Minister 
Indira Gandhi declared a state of 
emergency and transformed 
India from a fledgling democracy 
to a dictatorship run by her 
Congress Party. 

• 

Gude was in Delhi, the capi­
tal, on August 15, Indian inde­
pendence Day. He saw Gandhi 
speak. that day at the Red Fort, 
a fortress built by a past 
Moslem moghul (ruler). 

TRAVELIN' MAN: After retumlng from three IDOnth. of travel, Kay 
Gucle, an anthropology graduate, relates hi. experiences of IndIa. 

"Gandhi spoke from a high 
platform surrounded by 
guards," Gude, said. "The first 
several rows of the audience 
were made up of, foreign dig­
nitaries. 

"Most of the people I talked 
to in. India did not approve of 
Gandhi's dictatorial moves," he 
continued. "They weren' t com­
pletely free to talk about it, but 
she didn't seem to have the 
wholehearted support of the 
people. 

"Some say that' she has im­
proved the lot of the poor, " 
Gude said. "Others are appalled 
that many 'freedom fighters', 
who fought the British for in­
dependence, ' such as Jaya Pra­
kash Naryan, are now in jail as 
dissidents. 

"I don't believe her hold on 
the country is that secure. There 
could be chaos in the future if 
power struggles break out. " 

_ The second three weeks of 
Gude's stay were devoted to 
travel in northern In'dia. After 
the six-week period sponsored 
by the Ell had expired, Gude 
remained in India for an addi­
tional six weeks of personal 
travel in southern India. 

[photo by Romondo Davis]. 
"Our group visited v'aransi, 

perhaps the oldest city in India 
and ihe seat of Hindu culture," 
he said. "It's on the Ganges 
River and is one of the most 
'spiritual' places in India. 

"Every day thousands of 
people perform ritual baths and 
bowel movements in the river. 
Many cremations also take place 
there. 

"We also saw the Taj Mahal 
in Agra, a city just north of 
Delhi, " Gude added. "It is very 
impressive and could easily be 
the most beautiful building in 
the world. 

"Six of the America students 
left for the U.S. on August 24," 
he said. "One girl remained 
with me to do some personal 
traveling in southern India. 

"I enjoyed that part of the trip 
more than the other. We could 
travel at our own pace and 
didn ' t have to rush through 
everything. 

"Just south of Madras, the 
largest city in southern India, is 
a former French colony named 

Pondicherry," Gude mentioned. 
"It was quite a shock to see 
dark-skinned Indians speaking 
French as their native language. 
The city has a very European 
atmosphere, and was cleaner 
than most Indian cities. 

A & W announces: 

Buy any mama • BURGFR at regular pnce 
get a second one FREEl Great for two 
headed guys. or bring a friend. or Just a bog 
appetite! Our -mama/BURGER IS a 
sensational combinauon of a Bog Beef 
Patty. Super Sauce. Bacon and Cheese. 
plus the trimmingsl ' 

A big 
two 
fori 

sale!" --------­.~""'1I aile mama burger • I gel ~ second I 
I o"er=~~1 
I Coupon exp"e~ November 15 I 

Only one coopon gooo per party, 
. good only at (local address) 

• Where our food's Ci$ good as our Root Beer. • ---------A& W FAMilY RESTAURANT 
~ NATURAL BRIDGE RD. 

• IEL-RiDGE, MO. 63121 

"I also visited Aurorville, an 
international city in southern 
India, " Gude said. "The city, 
which has a United Nations 
charter, is an experiment by 
people of many different nation­
alities to adopt an Indian way of 
life. 

"I think this is good, for we 
should all develop a sense of 
world culture. I think we're 
moving toward that, and we 
should purposely strive for that. 

"Travel in India is very inex­
pensive," Gude continued. "I 
travelled by train from Calcutta 
in the north to Madras in the 
south - a distance of one 
thousand kilometers - for the 
equivalent of four dollars. " 

Gude found that many other 
things were inexpensive in 
India. "There is a lot of star­
vation, poverty and begging in 
India," he said. "I saw people 
who lived in flimsy shacks of 
canvas and wood that had a foot 
of water in them. 

. 'I brought this tremendous 
sense of American idealism to 
India," he said, " but I found 
out that there is only so much 
one man can do. 

"I gave money to beggars, 
but there was always another 
hundred or thousand in the area 
just as desparate. Beggars 
would stand by you for ftfteen 
minutes or half an hour for one 
piasa, a coin equal to one-tenth 
of a cent in American money. 

"In' American we have a song 
that says, 'How many times can 
a man tum his head and pretend 
that he just doesn' t see.' WeU. I 
found that I turned my head five 
times from a man with no legs 
and three times from a starving 
leper. 

"An experience like that can 
teach you a lot about yourself. 
It's depressing, but you find 
yourself getting used to it." 

Sunday, 

Oct. l' 
3:00 pm 

Sound Spectrum 
Wuhlngton University 
MadrIgal Slngen 

Tickets: 
$.50 stu'dents 
$3.50 general 

Music at Trinity 
Trinity Episcopal Church 
600 North Euclid 

, ~t .. Louis, Mo. 63108 
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AroundUMSL 
October I4-ZI 

Thursday 
SHORT COURSE: The compu­

ter center will offer a short 
course at 3 pm in room 226 SSB. 
The course is free and open to 
the public. For more information 
on the course call 453-5811. 

GALLERY 210: Photographs 
by Imogen Cunningham will be 
on display from 9 am until 9 pm 
in room 210 Lucas Hall. 

MEETING: Pi Sigma Epsilon 
will hold a meeting at 1 :30 pm 
in room 121 J.C. Penney. 

MEETING: The Computer 
Center Advisory Board will hold 
a meeting at 2:30 pm in room 
229 J .C. Penney. 

COMMUNIVERSITY: A class 
In figure drawing will be held at 
7 pm in room 207 Lucas Hall. 
Communiversity classes are free 
and open to UMSL students and 
the community. 

COMMUNlVERSITY: Chinese 
philosophy will be discussed at 
6:30 pm in room 413 Clark Hall. 

Friday 
FILM: "The Three Muske­

teers" will be shown at 8 pm in 
room 101 Stadler Hall. Admis­
, ion is $,75 with an UMSL ID . . 
UMSL IDs are accepted from 
UMSL students, faculty. alumni 
md staff. An ID permits one 
:uest and one member of the 
mmediate family to attend the 
i lm.) 

REHEARSAL: The Black Stu­
dent Choir will have a rehearsal 
at 5:30 pm in room 117 Lucas 
Hall. 

SHORT COURSE: The Com­
puter Center will offer a short 
course at 3 em in room 226 SSB, 
The course is free and open to 
the public. For more information 
call 453-5811. 

WOMEN'S FIELD HOCKEY: 
UMSL plays SIU/Edwardsville at 
4 pm at UMSL. 

GALLERY 210: Photographs 
by Imogen Cunningham will be 
on display from 9 am until 9 pm 
in room 210 Lucas Hall. 

FILM: "Wozzeck", a German 
film based on a drama by 
George Bucher, will be shown at 
12:45 and 8 pm in the J.C. 
Penney Auditorium. The film 
has English subtitles. 

SEMINAR: There will be a 
Biology seminar at 3 pm in room 
316 Stadler Hall. 

KWMU: The student staff 
brings you "Friday Magazine" 
from 11 pm Friday until 7 am 
Sat. morning on KWMU (90.7 
FM). 

Saturday 
FILM: "The Three Muske­

teers" will be shown at 8 pm in 
room 101 Stadler Hall. Admis­
sion is $.75 with an UMSL ID. 

SOCCER: The Rivermen play 
the University of Illinois/ Chicago 
Circle at 2 pm in Chicago, 
Illinois. 

WORKSHOP: There will be a 
vocal music workshop at 9 am in 
room 100 Clark Hall. 

MEETING: St. Louis Associa­
tion of Wargamers will hold a 
meeting at 11 am in room 215 
Clark Hall. 

CROSS COUNTRY: UMSL 
plays Washington University and 
Principia College at 11 am in 
Forest Park. 

WOMEN'S FIELD HOCKEY: 
UMSL plays Greenville College 
at 11 am in Greenville, Illinois. 

WOMEN'S VOLLEYBALL: 
UMSL participates in the Mur­
ray State Tournament at 9 am in 
Murray, Kentucky. 

TRAINING SESSION: There 
will be a training session for 
volunteers in the Probation and 
Parole program at 9 am in rooms 
114 and 118 Lucas Hall. 

WORKSHOP: The Fine Arts 
department will hold a workshop 
at &30 am in room 100 Clark 
Hall. 

COMMUNIVERSITY: A class 
in figure drawing will be held at 
9:30 am in room 133 SSB. 

Sunday 
MEETING: Tau Kappa Epsi-' 

Ion will hold a meeting at 6 pm 
in room 202 Benton Hall. 

Slum Son Slim 

FILM: "Grapes of Wrath " 
will be shown in St. Louis 
University's Kelley Auditorium 
at 7 pm. The film is part of a 
benefit for the United Farm 
Workers . Admission is free , but 
donations will be accepted. 

MEETING: Epsilon Beta 
Gamma will hold a meeting at 4 
pm in room 272 U~iversity 
Center. 

MEETING: Pi Kappa Alpha 
Pledges will hold a meeting at 6 
pm in room 208 Clark Hall. 

MEETING: Pi Kappa Alpha 
will hold a meeting at 7 pm in 
room 217 Clark Hall. 

MEETING: Alpha Xi Delta 
will hold a meeting in room 212 
Clark Hall at 5 pm, room ISS 
University Center at 6 pm and in 
room 211 Clark Hall at 7 pm. 

MEETING: Sigma Tau 
Gamma will hold a meeting at 8 
pm in room 205 Clark Hall. 

MEETING: Central Council 
will hold a meeting at 2 pm in 
room 132 SSB. All students are 
invited to attend. 

MEETING: Delta Zeta will 
hold a meeting at 5 pm in room 
202 Benton H~II. . 

KWMU: The student staff will 
prescnt the " Midnight till 
Morning" from 1 until 6 am 
Sunday morning on KWMU 
(9Q.7 FM). 

Monday 
TWICE TOLD TALES: "Oliver 

Twist," which was made in 
1947, will be shown at 8:15 pm 
in the J.C: Penney Auditorium. 
The film is free and open to the 
public. 

KOFFEE KLATSCH: The 
Evening College Council will 

,provide coffee and cookies for 
students at 4:30 pm in the 3rd 
floor lobby of Lucas Hall. 

WOMEN'S FIELD HOCKEY: 
UMSL plays St. Louis University 
at 4 pm at UMSL. 

GALLERY 210: Photographs 
by Imogen Cunningham will be 
on display from 9 am until 9 pm 
in room 210 Lucas Hall. 

MEETING: There will be a 
Sible Study meeting at 11:40 am 
in room 266 University Center. 

HELICOPtER LANDING: A 
helicopter will land in the valley 
between UMSL's east parking 
lots and Lucas and Clark Halls 
at 8 :30 am. The activity is 
sponsored by the UMSL Flyers. 

KWMU: The student staff will 
prese'nt the "Midnight till 
morning" program from mid­
night until 6 am Monday morn-, 
ing on KWMU (90.7 FM). 

Tuesday 
TWICE TOLD TALES: "Oliver" 
which was made in 1968, will be 
shown at 8:15 pm in room 101 
Stadler Hall. Admission is free 
and open to the public. 

MEETING: The Social Work 
Club will have Roy Diebold , 
representative of the St. Louis 
County Drug Abuse and Preven­
tion Center as a ~peaker for the 
Social Work Club. The meeting 
will begin at 3:15 pm in room 
225 J.C. Penney. All are wel­
come to come I 

COM MUNIVERSITY: Jhe 
Chinese art of self-defense, 
Kung Fung will be demonstrated 
at 6:30 pm in roon1 413 Clark 
Hall. 

KOFFEE KLATSCH: The 
Evening College Council will 
provide coffee and cookies for 
students from 4:30 until 8:30 pm 
in the 3rd floor lobby of Lucas 
Hall. 

GALLERY 210: Photographs 
by Imogen Cunningham will be 
on display from 9 am until 9 pm 
in room 210 Lucas Hall. 

SEMINAR: There will be a 
special Chemistry Seminar at 
3:30 pm in room 120 Benton 
Hall. 

Wednesday 
WORKSHOP: There will be a 

program workshop at 8:30 am in 
room 121 J.C. Penney. 

WOMEN'S VOLLEYBALL: 
UMSL plays UMC at 6 pm at 
UMSL. 

TRIVIA CONTEST: The Dr. 
Pepper Defense League will hold 
a "trivia contest" at 11 am in 
J.C. Penney Auditori~m. 

GALLERY 210: Photographs by 
Imogen Cunningham will be on 
display from 9 a!YI until 9 pm in 
room 210 Lucas Hall. 

MEETING: The Senate Re­
search and Publication commit­
tee will hold a meeting at 3:30 
pm in room 266 University 
Center. 

MEETING: The Central 
Council Executive Committee 
will hold a meeting at 7 pm in 
room 266 University Center. 

WOMEN'S POETRY RAP: 
There will be a women's poetry 
rap session at 7:30 pm on 
October 20th. The session will 
give women the opportunity to 
read, listen, or discuss poems 
they have written. Call 423-6608 
for directions to the rap session 
for more information. 

Thursday 
TH~ATER: The University 

Players will pre~ent " Bye, Bye 
Birdie" at 8 .pm in room 105 
Benton Hall. Ticket prices are $1 
with an UMSL ID and $2 for the 
public. 

GALLERY 210: Photographs 
by Imogen Cunningham will be 
on display from 9 am until 9 pm 
in 1:oom 210 Lucas Hall. 

COMMUNIVERSITY: A class 
in figure drawing will be held at 
7 pm in room 207 Lucas Hall. 

COMMUNIVERSITY: Chinese 
Philosophy will be discussed at 
6:30 pm in room 413 Cla~k, Hall. 

INFORMATION WELCOME: 
Students can submit information 
on activities for Around UMSL 
in room 256 University Center. 
Deadline for the information is 
the Monday before the paper 
comes out. 
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Profe~sor's study yields reward 
Sue Schweitzer 

Dr. Thomas Uhlman, associate 
professor of political science, 
received the Edward S. Corwin 
Award from the American Polit­
ical Science Association at its 
convention in Chicago early in 
September. Every two years the 
Association awards the best 
doctoral thesis in the fields of 
public law, courts, and the 
judiciary process. 

Edward S. Corwin was . a 
leading Constitutional lawyer 
who did his most important work 
in the 1930's. 

Entitled, "Black Judges and 
Defendants in the Metro City 
Criminal Court, 1968-1974," 
Uhlman's study found that black 
defendants are getting much 
tougher sentences at the hands 
of both black and white judges. 
Uhlman explained however, that 
this is not necessarily the result 
of discrimination. 

•• Sentences are determined 
after studying the individual's 
past record of arrests and con­
victions, and more lengthy terms 
are given to those with a, history 
of serious offenses," said Uhl­
man. "Since more blacks than 
whites repeat crimes, it is blacks 
who are served with more S"evere 
sentences.' , 

Uhlman's thesis explores an 
area where little research has 
been done previously and fo­
cuses on the decision-making of 
trial court judges, a politically 
important group that has been 
growing rapidly in the last ten 
years. 

Many barriers to aspiring 
black judges stilI exist. "Among 
these barriers are the exclusion 
of blacks from white law schools 
and bar associations; alleged 
LSAT bias; and resistance by the 
predominantly white judicial and 
political elite." 

Dr . Uhlman completed the 

Christopher McKarton 

, 
5SO-page dissertation while at 
the University of North Carolina 
at Chapel Hill. Two grants from 
the Justice Department allowed 
him to do the study. which was 
a year and a half in the making. 

In Chapel Hill, where Uhlman 
did his research, there was no 
evidence supporting the notion 
that black judges favor defen­
dants of their own race. "Black 
judges convict 56.7 per cent of 
the black defendants (of this 
particular city) while barely 
finding a majority (50.5 per cent) 
of the whites guilty," says 
Uhlman. "White judges find 
black defendants guilty 62.7 per 
cent of the time as compared to 
54 per cent of the time for white _ 
defendants. " 

Uhlman is using his paper as 
part of his Urban Justice class. 
He bdieves professors should 
share results of their research 
with students, and regrets that 
there is not more student-faculty 
involvement. 

C14RIS, I' M SORRY. YOu KNOW 
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KNOW n~~~~~: .. IIIIIIIIII. 

@ji)/iJ//V// II ~ 
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. 'Q)"", Go ""HaE. ,",,00 
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BLACK SIX ON RED SEVEN: An UMSL student takes a break from 
studylog and tries her skfll at a game of soUtaire. 

, .... THIS IS THE ~ouR 
OFLEAP ··REMEMBE~ED, 
IF OUTLIVED . ASFREE'Z 
PERSONS RECOLLECT THE 
SNOW·· " 

N0800,( l'OOL..S AROUN D 

W'T~ MY QUE~N ANO 

C:JE'T S AWA'( W \ T'; IT!! 



Page 12 October 14, 1976 UMSL CURRENT 

Windom: entertaining, charming 
Terry Mahoney 

When we saw how William 
Windom was dressed to portray 
James Thurber, it caused us 
some wotry. There he stood on 
the J.C. Penney Auditorium 
stage in a green eyeshade, 
yellow socks and a half-but­
toned-down button-down collar 
shirt. That's the same sort of 
costume Windom wore when 
playing the altogether lovable 
Johnathan Monroe of televi­
sion's short-lived "My World 
and Welcome to It. " 

stabbing gossip, a liar, and a 
man who threw food at people in 
restaurants. 

Windom, though, described 
him as having been "a very 
warm fellow," so it seemed 
inevitable that the actor would 
further the apparent myth of 
Thurber the all-good through his 
stage show. ' 

But he didn't do it. 
Windom's performance was 

restricted to readings. Despite 
any confusing promotion to the 
contrary, he did not in fact make 
an effort at playing Thurber; he 
just told the stories. And he told 
them fine. 

But the television Monroe 
wasn't Thurber, no matter how 
much Monroe's background and 
behavior were adapted from 
Thurber's original book to re- The stories were of remark-

We, suspect that it was Win­
dom's popularity and not Thur­
ber's prose that drew the sell­
out audience; a touring company 
production of "The Thurber 
Carnival" - here in 1974 drew 
pathetically. 

The essence of Windom's 
drawing power, his soft, easy 
charm, is well-suited to the 
varied characters he was called 
on to play. His small gestures, 
subtle inflections and timing 
served as a fine vehicle for 
Thurber's familiar subjects: 
combative spouses, talking ani­
mals , and men horrified by 
approaching middle age. 

semble his creator. The televi- able variety, as was his ap- Keeping silent about the real 
sion Monroe was the popular proaches to them. Windom was Thurber, we imagine, was about 
image of Thurber - bumbling, appropriately .acerbic, miffed the only thing he honestly could 
cute, adorable. and downright nasty as a com- do. We have no reasonl to 

History suggests the real mentator on marriage, advising presume he could decipher, 
Thurber was... something else. women to put turtles in their much less portray, Thurber's 
In "Here at the New Yorker" husbands' beds. When descri- enigmatic character any better 
Brendan Gill renders the testi- bing the death of a beloved than any other reader. 

TYPING UP A STO'kM: WUllma Windom presenting many se:;.riero mony of several writers _ poodle, he manages to be While Windom's appearance 
. and comments In his appeuance at UMSL. [photo by Romondo including Gill himself _ that moving while completely avoid- may have done little to educate, 
_:D:.:a:.:vi:s~):.. _______________________ ....... Thurber was at times a back- ing sentimentality. it did plenty to entertain. 

I _ 

~ Chicag 0': ~?",~J !!!~on~!l °A!~d~! b!!!~.d ~~~!!,llli'~O~~"" n !?!.!~.'tiOD willi Chi. 
B,U WUSOD h lb h' h t' havior onstage and the audIence fa'lrly self evident· the medley cago IS whether there IS any 

James Pankow grinned and 
raised his cup to the audience. 
"This is unofficially our tenth 
year together, and we' re very 
glad to share it with you. I'd like 
to introduce you to everybody 
here, because we're a group 

'" that's decided to stay together 
for awhile." 

Corrections and 
amp lificatio ns 

Last issue's review of "The 
Magic Flute" was incorrect with 
reference to the benefit showing 
on Wed., Oct. the 20th which 
will mark the beginning of a 
two-week engagement at the 
Varsity Theatre, 6610 Delmar 
Blvd. Tickets are available at the 
University City Public Library. 
"Angel" - contributors of $25 
- and holders of $10 tickets 
may attend a live musical enter­
tainment at the library (6701 
Delmar) lasting from 8:30 to 10 
pm. That frrst night there will be 
two showings of the film, one at 
7 pm and the other at 9:30. 

Classifieds 

WANTED 

Desperately need a ride, will 
share expenses. Richmond 
Heights area. Call 781-6525. 

PosmONS AVAILABLE 

JOBS ON SHIPS! American. 
Foreign. No experience re­
quired. Excellent pay. World­
wide travel. Summer job or 
career. Send $3.00 for infor­
mation. SEAFAX, Dept. g-10 
Box 2049, Port Angeles, Wash­
ington 98362. 

SALE 

'68 Chevy Biscayne , Oood 
Running Condition - $300. _ call 
726-6179 (after 5 pm weekdays). 

Good tickets for Mizzou-Iowa 
State Homecoming Game Sat. 
Oct. 16 - $8, Ruth Edwards 
647-3100 (7am to 3 pm) 

TUTORING 

All levels German, Europen 
and American History, General 
Study Skills. Call Michael 
Murphy, 725-2864. 

tent a urn, one w IC con 1- • ' . -. b . Th' b 
t d d d I reaction to the proceedings, It from side two of "Chicago 2" chance of reakmg up. IS est 

nthu:s b
O 

edxpand di~n evtelo
p 

would seem that the musical was excellent primarily because answered by the band itself: 
elr roa an verse s yes, . . . d db' . "I th'nk ' t d 

from the heavy orchestration and group Chicago will. m ee e the audience was anxiously a- . I we ve go a soun _ 
b'll F h h "If You together for a long time to come, waiting the J'azzy horns of "West that WIll be popular for many 1. owy renc orns on . Lo . " 
Leave Me Now (Cetera)" to the Chicago was m St. UIS on Virginia Fantasies" to fade .into ye~,rs., 

I . t L ti- A . b t f Oct 8 for a two and one half the gently pl'ano and woodwmds We ve been through some a mos a n merlcan ea 0 • . th did ' 
"A h R ' D . N hour concert at the Arena. of "Colour .My World" When hard times toge er an on t not er amy ay m ew . h' h- ld I't 
Y k C'ty (L ) " Describing chicago as a '"Robert Lamm suddenly started t ink anyt . 109 cou sp I us or I amm . . I" th th up " There are as many styles of "muslca group ra:r an banging out on his piano the . 
music in the group as there are "rock" group was dehbera~e . 
musicians. On the heels of because, un~oubtably, that IS 
"Chicago Ten," the group is the way. Chicago would have 
currently on yet another of their wanted It. As R~bert Lamm, 
national tours, and one small probably the group s most well-
night of it was spent in the St. known member says: 
L ' A "The thing that makes us so OUIS rena. . h' 

The most common critique pupular IS that t ere IS no 
,that would be heard from the particular. style that you can 
audience at the concert would confme 'Us 10. We have as many 
probably that the show was too styles as there .are mem~ers of 
short. The crowd was very re- the group. I think that IS what 
ceptive, and the band made the ~ppeal.s to most peop,l~ - there 
most of it, Pankow being the IS ,~ot Just one so~nd. 
chief capitalizer. That flashy . The way w~ tttle .our. albums 
musician was either joking with IS very claSSical In ItS ap-
other band members, winking proach," stated Pankow .. ",~en 
and laughing with fans in the we number ~ur albums, It s like 
first few rows of seats, leading we are leavmg a, legacy for the 
the crowd in clapping sessions, future. Whe~ we r~ gone, hope-
or occasionally playing the trom- fully somethmg will have been 
bone. left behind for years ~o come." 

line arts 
openng notes of "Saturday in 
the Park," a minor -classic that 
has become somewhat of a 
musical standard, the crowd 
came to its feet. The brass 
section was especially good on 
the opening number, titled, ap­
propriately enough, "Begin­
nings," a song from their pre­
mier album that immediately set 
a brisk pace for all still to come. 
Chicago's concert favorite, 
"Twenty-five or Six to Four," 
was not saved for the encore, 
and was moved into rather too 
quickly for maximum affect of 
the opening thumping-bass beat. 

, 'We change with the times, 
so I think we can keep going as 
long as we want." 

"We work together so weI and 
have been together for so long, 
that I think we could quite 
possibly go on indefinitely like 
Count Bassie has. That would 
really be great." 

"We're very close on and off 
stage ... " 

"Chicago will be around as 
long as we can contin~e to enjoy 
music, experiment and expand." 

It is nice to hear a group that 
agrees on things for change. 

~dl Oh, gimme one last kiss! 

He's Conrad Blrdle. • 
He's a teen Idol, groaning his way to fame, fortune, and the top of the charts. But there's one 
problem: he's been drafted. 
Conrad's last performance wUI Include his number one fan In-Sweet Apple, Ohlo ... 15.year.old 
KIm Macafee. It will also Include one, last, glorious Idss. 
Or ... wUIlt? 

The University Players present: 

BYE BYE 
BIRDIE 

A sUghtJy satricaI mnscfal oddessey Into the 1950's. 

Oct. 21, 22, 23, 24 
I . 

8 pm; 105 Benton Hall 
Tickets $2, UMSL stu~ents $1 
(at info desk) 
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'N orman, Is that Y 011 ?' gives sympathetic view 
Ruth Thaler mate is definitely swishy, and ' 

Homosexuality is a subject reveals that "Normie" ain't 
which is often considered taboo, "normal." 
and very few attempts have Perhaps the Miracles' song 
been made to deal with it "Ain't Nobody Straight in 
sympathetically in any media. L.A. ," gave someone the idea of 
Film is perhaps one of the most locating the plot in that city. For 
difficult arenas in which to air whatever reason, some of the 
this emotion-laden subject. views are lovely, and Fon's 

"Norman, Is That You? " venture into Brentano's after 
functions as vehicle for the wandering down the Boulevard 
comic talents of Redd Foxx, but is hysterical as he attempts to 
it is at the same time a convince the sales people that all 
well-done, thoughtful handling those books on homosexualty are 
of homosexuality, and the family "for a friend - not a close 
reactions to discovering this 'friend, in fact I just met him, 
bug-a-boo in their own backyard. ub , really, this isn't for me." 

Foxx portrays Ben Chambers, Michael Warren is a relative 
a self-employed and self-over- unknown, but he turns in an 
worked businessman whose excellent performance as the 
whole world has fallen in on him handsome. sensitive Nor'htan.His 
- his wif~, played by Pearl efforts to break things to his dad 
Bailey, has taken off to Mexico gently are ruined by roommate 
with his own brother. He hops a Garson, but his genuine concern 
bus to L.A. intending to fmd . for Foxx ' s feelings and his 
solace with his son Norman only determination to stick to his 
to find that things really can get guns are touching and ~mpathe-
even worse - Norman's room- tic. 

The only jarring note in the 
film might be the characteriza­
tion of Garson. His affectations 
are certain to upset many view­
ers, but this is necessary as a 
foil to the physical masculinity 
and character of Norman, and to 
underline the frightened reac­
tions of father Foxx. 

Once having accepted the fact 
that he can't order Norman to 
remain the "normal" heterosex­
ual man he wants his son to be, 
Foxx launches a one-man cure 
campaign. Tamara Dobson's 6 
foot-odd of solid sex-appeal is 
brought in as Foxx's idea of a 
cure, which results in Norman 
walking out in fury at his 
father's lack of understanding. 

Dobson ' s portrayal of the 
"happy hooker" is disappoint­
ing, as she lacks animation in 
delivering her lines and seems 
to think that all she need do is 
stand there looking gorgeous. 

When Pearl Baily shows up 
unexpectedly, havtng been disil­
lusioned with her brother-in­
law's offering of romance, things 
really start jumping. 

The reconciliation scenes be­
tween Foxx and Bailey are a 
delight, with Bailey presenting 
her liberated view of their mar-

, tied life which Foxx wa,s always 
too busy to notice, and delivery 
a couple of low-blows to the 
masculine ego : "Ben, for 
twenty-six years of married life, 
from 7 pm to 8 am, you were 
boring!" 

,Dad's efforts at effecting a'· 
reversal of Norman's sex habits 
are aided by a y'oung lady friend 
who gets him smashed just to 
throw his breakfast in his face 
when he doesn ' t remember 

. 'ravishing" her the next morn­
ing. 

Leave it to Mom to salvage 
things when Norman, in desper­
ation, enlists in the Navy. The 
ending is a surprise, and the 
film as a whole definitely a 
pleasure to watch. The comedy 
talents of Foxx, Bailey, and 
Warren are perfect for this 
story, and Garson is a gem. 

Watch out for the' side­
splitting antics of Wayland Flo­
wers weird and vocal hand-pup­
pets , which have been used 
recently in some Johnny Carson 
aclY.ertisinl!. 

Uarson attempts to calm and 
charm~ Norman ' s dismayed ' 
father with gourmet cooking, a 
night on the town,and revela- · 
tions about some .• Famous 
Homosexual Geniuses." 

'!i.~!!.at SCO'!!e::bY~!!~t!.r, 
behind and joins Marvin a!ld 

If you are looking for an 
eveQing of light-hearted enter­
tainment, see "The Great Scout 

, and Cathouse Thursday. " Its not 
a movie for aU ages , but it is a 
lot of bawdy fun. 

Lee Marvin and Oliver Reed 
star as the scout and his 
half· breed friend who are after 
their old gold prospecting part­
ner , played by- Robert Culp. 

.Apparently, Culp took off with 
Marvin' s fiancee and everyone's 
gold fifteen years ago, so' it is 
not just a social call that they 
want to make. 

In the course of trying to find 
Culp, Reed is also trying to 
revenge himself on all white 
men in a most unusual way. He 
steals a wagon full of whores 
being arrested, but lets them go 
when Marvin announces that 
their former partner is in town. 

Reed in their schemes. The 
results of this teaming up are 
the ki.dnapping of a shrewish ,~ 
wife, May-December romance, • 
one payroll robbery, and some 
good laughs throughout the 
movie. . ' I 

The main actors all 00 a good 
job in their comic roles, es­
pecially Lee Marvin as th e 
snorting old Scout with memor­
ies of better days . Kay Lenz 
provides a bright young face 
that is in laughable contrast with 
the old g irlfriend , played by 
Elizabeth Ashley, who's under­
gone a few changes in the fifo 
teen years that he has not seen 
her. Oliver Reed is really unique 
as the Indian half-breed with a 
social disease that he really does 
not want to get rid of. 

ARENA OF SOUND: Chicago goes Into their encore numbers at their October 8 concert at the 
&rena. [photo by Eric Nelson]. 

However, one of the young 
la4,ies. nicknamed Thursday , 

The pace of the film never 
drags, the dialogue is fast and 
generally funny , even though 
some of the antics are rather 
ridiculous. 

FIRST NORTH -AMERICAN TOUR 

PERFORMING 

The Taming of the Shrew 
This critically acclaimed English repertory company was formed as an outgrowth of the renowned 
National Theatre of Great Britain and has since become an independent entity. Its aim is to 
bring a new vitality and experimentation to classical and modern theatre while keeping 
production costs low. Imagination, not money, is the key to their work. ' The Young Vic was 
seen in the United States in 1973 when it played to sold-out houses in New York and Los Angeles 
with Moliere's "Scapino," a production which received 2 Tony nominations. The company has also 
appeared at major theatre festivals throughout Europe and in 1971 was chosen by the theatre 
critics of Madrid as the best foreign company to visit Spain that year. The London Evening­
Standard has described The Young Vic as "Not just alive .•• electri c! " 

Friday,October29 
800prn 
JC Penney Aud. 

UM student~2.50 ( $ 
~ fac.,staff,alumni 3.50 

Public$4.50 
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Riverwomen split 
with Flo Valley 
Lucy Zapf 

Recovering from a long road 
trip the week before, the UMSL 
volleyball team played only 2 
matches in the past week. But 
they were 2 of the toughest 
matches thus far and resulted in 
the Riverwomen suffering their 
first defeat. 

On Thursday: Oct. 7 UMSL 
played on their home court 
against Florissant Valley Junior 
College. The first game of the 
match found the Riverwomen 
following an established pattern 
of demolishing their opponent, 
this time 15-4. 

But the Norsewomen battled 
back and won the second game 
11-15. In the deciding game of 
the match UMSL triumphed 
15-11 and , remained undefeated 
for the season. 

"It was a beautiful match," 
was UMSL's coach Judy Whit­
ney's comment. "They've got a 

s o 

really tough team." 
Whitney's women found out 

just how tough they were on 
Monday night. Florissant Valley 
was the sight of the re-match. 
There the Riverwomen lost their 
first match of the season. 

The Norsewomen quickly 
handled the UMSL women with 
scores of 15-8, 15-5. Not only did 
Florissant Valley win, but they 
did so in two straight games. 
The los,S put the. UMSL spikers' 
record at 3-1 against junior 
colleges and 11-0 against col­
leges and universities. 

The Riverwomen journeyed to 
Columbia to face UMC and 
Northeast Missouri State on 
Tuesday evening. The results of 
the matches were not available 
when this paper went to press. 

Next on the schedule for 
UMSL will be another road trip. 
This time they will travel to 
Murray, Kentucky to participate 
in the Murray State Tourna­
ment. 

ts 

DON'T WORRY/ I'M COMING: Pat Hogan, captain of the Rivermen, seems to say to his 
teammate Dennis Doughtery. Doughtery was flanked by 2 Qulncy players whUe clearing the ball 
deep In UMSL territory during last Saturday's game. [pboto by Mark Pfister]. 

Rivermen hungry for vi~tory -
With the UMSL soccer team 

needing a victory more than 
ever, the Rivermen were called 
upon to take on highly-ranked 
Quincy College at home. It 
promised to be a hard-fought 
game with the hungry Rivermen 
holding a modest 2-4-1 record. 

ball looked like it was ' behind 
it," 'said Hudson. 

"That was the game. If that 
had been a goal, the clock would 
have stopped and they wouldn't 
have been able to move down­
field and score," he added, im­
plying that the Rivermen would 
have dropped into a defensive 
posture to defend a 1-0 lead over 
the final three minutes. 

season, and held their own 
against some of the top teains 
in the country. 

But one thing they , haven't 
accomplished is a victory over 
the SJU-EdwardsvilJe Cougars. 
Bob Guelker's SIU team has a 
7-0-1 mark over UMSL, the tie 
coming in 1973 when the River­
men were undefeated. 

UMSL will make its ninth 
attempt to defeat the Cougars 

Tennis bounces out 

The teams played evenly until , 
with 2:53 left to play, St. Louis 
native Bob Radice kicked a 
screamer into the upper-right 
hand coner of the UMSL goal to 
give Quincy the victory. 

The goal came just seconds 
after Rick Hudson of UMSL 
narrowly missed scoring for the 
Rivermen. Hudson's shot from 
close range was deflected by 
goalkeeper Eric Delabar and 
rolled near the goal line. 

However, other spectators 
near the goal line agreed with 
official Larry King's ruling that 
the ball touched the line, but did 
not go completely over. 

, Wednesday, Oct. 13, at Ed­
wardsville in a 4:30 game. The 
Rivermen will be decided under­
dogs, entering the game with a 
2-5-1 record. sm is ranked in 
the national top 10. 

Intramural tennis concluded 
play for the fall semester last 
week with two championships 
decided. The intermediate and 
advanced divisions saw matches 
played to determine winners. 

From the "B" bracket~ in 
intermediate competition Bill 
Heath challenged "A" bracket 
winner Gary Lum. Heath quickly 
defeated Lum in 2 sets 6-3, 6-3. 

In advanced play Lin Chew 
displayed his tennis prowess by 
again taking the advanced title. 
Chew beat Dave Carkett 6-2, 
6-3. Both players are faculty 
members and outstanding com­
petitors. 

During previous action the 
beginners' bracket found Joe 
Hagen declared the champion. 
Hagen won the title in a close 
match against Don Luster in the 

New volleyball 
being played 

Unstructured Vo\leyball is 
taking place on Sundays this Fall 
and everyone is invited . to come 
to the Multi-Purpose Building to 

. participate. The whole idea of 
the program is to provide fun 
and recreation to those who 
want just that. 

Teams have no limit on size or 
composition, and rules can be 
made just prior to the game. 
The rules are exactly that -
unstructured. Those interested 
should go to the Multi-Purpose 
Building for more information. 

Ski conditioning 
program offered 

Again this year the UMSL 
Intramural department will b~ 
offering a conditioning prograrr 
for those participating iii the 
Winter Park Ski Trip. The pro­
gram is d'esigned to help tone up 
muscles used for skiing. 

The primary program will 
begin on November 16 and will 
continue through December 9 on 
Tuesday and Thursday. The 
maintenance program will be 
held the weeks of December 14 
and 21, also on Tuesdays and 
Thursdays. The sessions will be 
held from noon to Ipm in Room 
161 of the Multi-Purpose Build­
ing. No sign-up is necessary and 
all the would be skiers are urged 
to participate. 

finals, 6-4, 7-6, 6-3. 
The three champions were the 

result of yet another successful 
single elimination tournament in 
which 53 UMSL students, faculty 
and staff participated. For all 
who missed this semester's play, 
tennis will be offered again 
during the spring semester. 

Hudson and other UMSL 
players on the field contended 
the ball was across the line and 
should have been ruled a goal. 
"J could see the line, and the 

Final football standings 

League 1 

The Ruggers 
The Pros 
Men of Best Destiny 

League 2 

Swamp Turkeys 
The Stooges 
Who's on First 
Rhinos 

Fraternity League 

Tau Kappa Epsilon 
Sigma Pi Wolfpack 
Pi Kappa Alpha 
Sigma Tau Gamma 

• 
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5 
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2 
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3 
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1 
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3 
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o 

o 
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1 
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In either case, the Quincy 
game is history, and the River­
men at 2-5-1 are hungrier than 
ever for a 'victory over a top­
ranked team. 

In nine years, the Rivermen 
have accomplished numerous 
goals here at UMSL. They have 
won a Division II national 
championship (1973), gone to 
four consecutiv~ regional tourn­
aments, never had a losing 

After meeting sm, the River­
men playa match just as i,mpor­
tant at the University of Illinois 
at Chicago Circle on Saturday, 
Oct. 16, at 2 pm. UlCC is trying 
to unseat the Rivermen as one of 
the teams in the Division 11 
Midwest Regionals. It will be 
Homecoming day for the Chikas 
as well. 

Sales Position Available 

Downtown Famous Barr has part-time sales 
openings for the 'Fall and Christmas 
Seasons. Training for the position ' will 
begin. in October. We are particularly 
interested in people with a strong fashion 
sense, and the ability to work with people. 
Sales experience is helpful but not. requir~ 
Applicants must be flexible enough to work 
day and/or evening hours. 
Availability from November 22 ,through 
December 24 is also. a must. Benefits 
include a good starting salary and mer­
chandise discounts. I nterested person 
should apply in person: 

Famous Barr -. Downtown, 
Employmen-t Office -11 th floor 

One for the lIIoney. 
TWlO for the shoVl. 
We're making it twice as easy to see Laserium. Bring this ad, a friend and $2.75 
for one ticket. And we'll spring for the other one. That's $2.75 off a $2.75 ticket. 
And that's not half bad. Laserium. Where live laser illusions and stimulating 
music are combined in a cosmic concert. Nightly, Wednesday thru Sunday, at 
7:30,9:00 and 10:30. This offer good for all perform­
ances except Saturday. Offer expires midnight, 
October 31, 1976. Laserium, at McDonnell 
Planetarium, 5100 CJayton Road, St. Louis. THE COSMIC ~R CONCERT 

B 



Busy week for'Intramurals 
Lucy Zapf 

In an" active week for the 
intramural program, one sport 
was started and one finished. 
Cross-country and cooed rac­
quetball participants competed 
last week. 

Bill Knott and Chris Prost 
took the racquetball champion­
ship. In a hard fought match 
they defeated Paul Russell and 
Alysn Hassenforder by a score 
of 18-21,21-17 and 21-20. 

The tournament was single 
elimniation with 14 teams com­
peting. Play was completed in 
one week's time in order to 
minimize tying up the courts. 

Single competition for men's 
racquetball will begin on Oct. 18 
while women's play will start on 
Nov. 15. 

Last Saturday the intramural 
cross-country race was run on a 
three-mile course set Of the 
Marillace campus. There were 3 
divisions for the runners. 

There were two brackets for 
fastest time; one for under and 
one for over thirty-year-olds. In 

the younge.r division the first to 
cross the finish line was Bob 
Borden with a time of 19:{)9.5. 
Borden was follQwed by Dan 
Sebben at 19:34 and Pat Conroy 
who took third with a time of 
19:50.5. 

In the over-thirty group Peter 
Grandstaff, an economics pro­
fessor, finished first, clocked at 
19:59.8. Second place went to 
Allan Gross at 26:33.5 and third 
to John Boswell with a time of 
26:47.5. 

The third area of competition 
was an estimated time category. 
The runners estimated their 
finishing times before the race. 
Boswell took first by predicting a 
time of 26:45. He finished just 
2.5 seconds .later than that time. 
Gross took second by finishing 
3.5 seconds slower than his esti­
mated 26:30. 

The times were extremely 
good considering the course's 
lay-out. ' 'We used a motorcycle 
to first mark the course," Jim 
Velten, intramural director, said. 
"Then we went through with a 
couple of lawn-mowers. Lastly · 

we had to stomp down a lot of 
mole-hiIls. " 

But there were other hills 
besides the ones the moles 
made. "It was a really hilly 
course, with a lot of bushes and 
weeds," Velten explained. 

"I ran the course several 
times and it really was rough," 
Velten concluded. 

Band looking 
for members 

As the basketball season ap­
proaches ball players are not the. 
only people in demand. Band 
members are needed for the Pep 
Band. The Pep Band performs 
during all Rivermen home 
games. The band attempts to 
add excitement and support to 
the games. 

There is no limit on the size of 
the band and all are welcome to 
audition. Anyone interested can 
contact Gary Brandes at 522-
3867 or Briget Focks at 521-
6494. 

SR-56 

UMSL CURRENT October 14, 1976 Page 15 

AND A WAY HE GOES: Bob Borden I'1IDIl.lng on the 3 mOe 
intramund cross country course. Borden took first place in the event. 
[photo by Scott Petersen]. 

-The super slide rule 
programmable powerhouse 

•.. with 10 memories and 100 program steps. 

The SR-56 is a tremen­
dously powerful slide rule 
calculator. Yet you can pro­
gram it whenever you're 
ready. 

There are 74 prepro­
grammed functions and op­
erations. You can do 
arithmetic within all 10 
memoriest. It has AOS - a 
unique algebraic operating 
system that lets you handle 
problems with up to 9 levels 
of parentheses. There's also 
polar to rectangular con­
version - built in. Mean . 
Standard deviation. De­
grees, radians, grads. And, 
it works with TI's new 
printer-the PC-100. 

Chances are, you'll be pro-

SPECIAL 
SR-56 
S1000 

Rebate 
Fill out coupon 

gramming. That's what pro­
fessionals in your field are 
doing-right now. And with 
an SR-56 you're ready. It 
has 100-merged prefix pro­
gram steps. 6 logical deci­
sion functions. 4 levels of 
subroutines. You can decrer 

. ment and skip on zero to 
iterate a loop as many times 
as you specify. There are 4 
levels of subroutine to let 
you use your program steps 
to maximum advantage. 
And, you can even compare 
a test register with the dis­
play to make a conditional 
branch. So you can check an 
intermediate result ~ 
for convergence, or a 
maximum. 

The edge you need. Now. And in your career. 
-----------------------------------------------------~----------------------, 

Texas Instru ments w ill rebate $10.00 of your orig inal 
SR-56 pu rchase pri ce when you return th is coupon 
and you r SR-56 customer information card post­
marked no later than October 31 ,1976. To apply : 
1. Fill out this cO,upon 
2. Fil l out spec ial serial ized customer information 

card inside SR-56 box 
3. Return completed coupon and information card to : 

Special Campus Offer 
P.O. Box 1210 
Richardson, Texas 75080 

Name 

Address 

City State Zip 

University 

Name?f SR-56 Retailer 

SR-56 _____ Serial No. (from back of calculator) 
Please aI/ow 30 days for rebate 

I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 

, I 
I 

L ______________________________ _ ____________ __ ________ ----------------- _____________ J 

· Suogested reta ~ price. 
11 1 with theT-register. 
© 1976 Texas Instruments Incorporated 

TEXAS INSTRUMENTS 
INCORPORATED 65539 

• 
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Called "the best of the best," 
The Modern Jazz Quartet has the 
longest life of any ensemble in 
the history of jazz. This much­
recorded quartet is a musical 
landmark--its style a classic, 
its sound a legend . 

Always expanding the horizons 
of its art yet never straying 
from its own direction , the MJQ, 
as it is known to admirers the 
world over, has made a distinctive 
mark on music both in the U.S. and 
abroad. These four outstanding 
artists have performed at the 
International Jazz Festival in 
Nice , the Maggio Musicale in 
Florence and the Donaueschingen 
Festival in Germany. They have 
t aken their music into the con­
cert hal ls of the world, including 
the Mozarteum in Salzburg and 
Ca~negie Hall i n New York . ln the 
Uni ted States they have played at 
the Newport and Monterey Jazz 
Festivals , as well as performing 
with such major classical en­
sembles as the Julliard String 
Quartet and with more than 
thirty symphony orchestras . 

Making the most refined sound in 
jazz, the quartet has played to­
gether for over twenty years, and 
in that time their sound has been 
fine -honed and polished to a degree 
defying imitation. Named "Best 
Small Jazz Ensemble in the U.S.A." 
by Dow~beat magazine, The Modern 
Jazz Quartet has perfected the 
balance between composed and im­
provised music in a way no other 
group has , weaving the great jazz 
tradition of individual virtuosity 
into the fabric of ensemble playing. 

WEDNESDAY, NOVEMBER~D-.B:3DPM 
POWELL SVMPONV HALL 

1 
, 

LOCATION Pub lic I 
1 

1 , 
Grand Ti er Box 1 $7 .50 
Dres s Circle Box I 7.50 
Grand Tier Loge I 7.00 
Parquet Center 1 7.00 
Orche s tra A-V I 6.50 I 

Orchestra W-CC 1 6.00 
Dress Circle I 6.50 I 

Lower Balcony I 5.50 i 

Upper Balcony I 4.50 I 
I 
~ 

Faculty/St a ff 1 
1 
1 & Alumni , 
I 

! $6 .50 
! 6.50 
I 6.00 
: 6.00 
! 5.50 
! 5.00 
l 5.50 
! 4 .50 
I 4.00 I 
I 

' I , 
1 , , 
I 

I 

I , 
I 

I 

I 

l 
I 
I 
I 

Student 

$6.00 
6.00 
5.50 
5.50 
5.00 
4.50 
5.00 
4.00 
3.50 

Tickets on sale, beginning Monday , Oc tober 18th 
at t h e University Center Inf ormat ion De sk. 
Discount t icke t s are available only at UMSL 
in advance of t h e concert. 

Presented by the Universi t y Pr ogram Board and the Performing Arts & Cultur al Events Committee 
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